

**UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA**

ANIMAL WELFARE INSTITUTE, et al.,)

Plaintiffs,)

v.)

FELD ENTERTAINMENT, INC.,)

Defendant.)

Case No: 03-2006 (EGS/JMF)

**DEFENDANT FELD ENTERTAINMENT, INC.'S PETITION FOR
ATTORNEYS' AND EXPERT WITNESS FEES**

EUGENE GULLAND DECLARATION

EXHIBIT 1 (Part 2)

(EG, Ex. 1 (Part 2))

**Key to Color Coding and Annotations in Covington Invoices
(Ex. 1 to Gulland Declaration)**


 White Box = Redacted for Privilege (Attorney-Client & Work Product).

 Tan = Time billed by a summer associate.

 Orange = Time spent on transition of the case between Fulbright and Covington.

 Blue = Time spent on the elephant veterinary records issue.

 Purple = Time billed by a timekeeper with fewer than 10 hours on the ESA Case.

 Gray = Time spent on administrative tasks.

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60301227
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
May 21, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period April 1, 2003, through April 30, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
4/1/03	Calls w/H. Weinstein on pending issues; emails to Wolson.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/1/03	Review statute and regulations surrounding captive-bred wildlife to update motion to dismiss.	2.25	Joshua Wolson
4/1/03	Review emails re meeting with Department of Interior attorneys; research re "19(j) actions;" telephone conference with Harris Weinstein re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
4/2/03	Review Wolson memo updating issues and ESA cases.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
4/2/03	Update motion to dismiss.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
4/3/03	Calls w/DOJ and J. Strauss; call from Meyer.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/4/03	Edit Wolson draft of District Court filing; calls w/DOJ concerning issues and scheduling meeting; calls w/J. Strauss.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/4/03	Review proposed submission to court and telephone call to Gene Gulland re: same	0.25	Harris Weinstein
4/4/03	Review and edit draft Defendants' Suggestion on Procedures To Be Followed Upon Remand.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
4/7/03	Review pleadings and send excerpts to DOJ; calls w/McKeown.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/8/03	Prepare binders for Department of Interior with materials from motion to dismiss.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
4/9/03	Prepare for DOJ meetings.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
4/9/03	Review briefs and prepare for meeting with Department of Interior attorneys.	2.25	Jeannie M. Perron

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPC v Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60301227

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
4/10/03	Meeting w/Department of Interior lawyers and staff; review to J. Strauss on same and district court draft submission.	3.25	Eugene D. Gulland
4/10/03	Meeting at Department of Interior with Mr. Gulland and Ms. Perron; followup.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
4/10/03	Prepare for, travel to and from, and meeting with Gene Gulland, Josh Wolson, and Department of Interior attorneys re suit.	2.00	Jeannie M. Perron
4/11/03	Calls w/DOI lawyers re: issues in PAWS brief; file memo w/district court.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/14/03	Calls w/DOI re: pending cases under ESA; review fax.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
4/18/03	Calls w/court and review new PETA tapes.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/29/03	Privilege	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
Total Hours:		25.50	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$540.00	13.00	\$7,020.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	0.25	\$135.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$360.00	5.25	\$1,890.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$270.00	7.00	\$1,890.00
Total			25.50	\$10,935.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	271.50
Computer Research	16.55
Facsimile	0.00
Fax Long Distance	0.00
Couriers And Messengers	7.00
Messengers	6.34
TOTAL	\$ 301.39

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60301227

Total Fee:	\$ 10,935.00
Total Client Charges:	301.39
Total This Invoice:	<u>\$ 11,236.39</u>

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60301227

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
 WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
 TEL 202.682.6000
 FAX 202.682.6291
 WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
 NEW YORK
 LONDON
 BRUSSELS
 SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
 60303604
 ACCOUNT NUMBER
 025557.00106
 DATE
 June 13, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period May 1, 2003, through May 31, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/2/03	Response to Plaintiffs' submission and calls on same.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
5/9/03	Calls w/Meyer and Sullivan's clerk; call to Department of Interior on same.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
5/30/03	Confer w/H. Weinstein, et al about Court order on supplemental briefing and oral argument; review pleadings.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
Total Hours:		3.50	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$540.00	3.50	\$1,890.00
Total			3.50	\$1,890.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	2.40
TOTAL	\$ 2.40

Total Fee:	\$ 1,890.00
Total Client Charges:	2.40
Total This Invoice:	\$ 1,892.40

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60303604

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy



COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
 WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
 TEL 202.682.6000
 FAX 202.682.6291
 WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
 NEW YORK
 LONDON
 BRUSSELS
 SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
 60306983
 ACCOUNT NUMBER
 025557.00106
 DATE
 July 17, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period June 1, 2003, through June 30, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/3/03	Review motion to dismiss and subsequent briefs.	2.75	Joshua Wolson
6/4/03	Review status of all pending USDA/ESA investigations; calls and emails on same.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/4/03	Research developments in Chevron doctrine since briefing on motion to dismiss took place.	2.25	Joshua Wolson
6/4/03	Draft email to Gene Gulland re update of information for court filing; telephone conference with Julie Strauss re same.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/5/03	Review investigation files (2000-2003) and Section 17.22 permit; calls on same.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/5/03	Research recent developments in deference to administrative agencies for supplemental brief.	2.75	Joshua Wolson
6/6/03	Research judicial notice in motions to dismiss for supplemental brief.	5.25	Joshua Wolson
6/9/03	Research recent developments in Chevron deference for supplemental brief.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
6/10/03	Review CBW permits and AWA lienses; emails w/Perron, et al; outline supplemental brief for Wolson.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/10/03	Legal research for and draft outline of supplemental brief on motion to dismiss.	4.25	Joshua Wolson
6/11/03	Finalize Wolson outline for supplemental brief; calls on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/11/03	Outline, research applicable regulations for, and begin drafting supplemental brief on motion to dismiss.	3.25	Joshua Wolson
6/11/03	Review draft letters to Chester Gipson re closure of investigations.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60306983

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/12/03	Review additional list of Aphie investigations and letters re: same; emails w/Perron.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
6/12/03	Review files and draft memo to litigation team re APHIS investigations of Ringling that were opened as of the fall of 2000 or since and that have closed.	1.75	Jeannie M. Perron
6/13/03	Research and draft supplemental memorandum in support of motion to dismiss.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
6/16/03	Draft supplemental memorandum in support of motion to dismiss.	6.75	Joshua Wolson
6/17/03	Edit supplemental memorandum in support of motion to dismiss.	6.25	Joshua Wolson
6/18/03	Edit supplemental memorandum.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
6/19/03	Review Wolson draft of supplemental memorandum; confer with team on same; review regulations.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/19/03	Respond to e-mails discussing draft response to supplemental memorandum; follow-up factual investigation about the status of USDA investigations.	1.75	Joshua Wolson
6/20/03	Work on supplemental memorandum; review regulations, cases and old pleadings.	5.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/20/03	Edit supplemental memorandum in support of motion to dismiss.	3.75	Joshua Wolson
6/20/03	Review supplemental brief; research issues re attachments to brief; telephone conference with Julie Strauss and FWS FOIA Office re same; telephone conferences with Josh Wolson re same.	3.50	Jeannie M. Perron
6/23/03	Calls w/Julie Strauss; edit and finalize supplemental memorandum.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/23/03	Assemble and file supplemental memorandum in support of motion to dismiss.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
6/23/03	Review PAWs supplemental petition; meeting with Josh Wolson re attachments; review email from Glenn Ewell to Kenneth Feld.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
6/25/03	Review Plaintiffs' Supplemental Response.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
6/26/03	Review plaintiffs' supplemental memorandum and new cases.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
6/27/03	Read cases for oral argument.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/27/03	Review plaintiffs' supplemental memorandum.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
6/30/03	Oral argument preparation.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
Total Hours:		74.00	

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60306983

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$540.00	19.25	\$10,395.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$360.00	7.00	\$2,520.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$270.00	47.75	\$12,892.50
Total			74.00	\$25,807.50

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	35.10
Computer Research	653.93
Telephone Calls	19.30
Couriers And Messengers	16.00
Metered Mail	2.12
TOTAL	\$ 726.45

Fee:	\$ 25,807.50
Less Discount:	(2,000.00)
Subtotal Fee:	23,807.50
Total Client Charges	726.45
Grand Total:	\$ 24,533.95

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60306983

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy



1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60309822
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
August 14, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period July 1, 2003, through July 31, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/2/03	Review new Chevron authorities cited by ASPCA; calls with team.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
7/7/03	Outline oral argument; confer w/Wolson re: summary of ESA cases involving Chevron issues.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/8/03	Finish oral argument outline.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
7/8/03	Research court treatment of "take" permits under ESA.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
7/9/03	Research court treatment of permits issued under Endangered Species Act for oral argument on motion to dismiss.	1.75	Joshua Wolson
7/10/03	Prepare for argument.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/11/03	Oral argument preparation (record and cases).	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/11/03	Research cases addressing permits and regulations issued under the Endangered Species Act.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
7/14/03	Prepare for argument.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
7/14/03	Research and draft e-mail re: cases decided under endangered species act and treatment of permits issued under the Act.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
7/15/03	Oral argument preparation.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
7/15/03	Revise draft e-mail re: treatment of permits issued under Endangered Species Act.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
7/16/03	Argument preparation; calls with Clerk and team about argument.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/17/03	Calls with Sullivan's clerk re: record.	0.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/30/03	Review district court decision; numerous calls and conferences on same.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60309822

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/30/03	Review order on motion to dismiss; review requirements of Federal and local rules to determine subjects on which we must meet and confer before court-ordered status conference.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
7/30/03	Review Order and revised Order; telephone conference with Julie Strauss, Harris Weinstein and Josh Wolson re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
7/31/03	Team meetings re: case; calls and emails w/J. Strauss.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/31/03	Review opinion; discuss same and next steps with Gene Gulland, Jeannie Perron and Josh Wolson; with Gene Gulland telephone call to Julie Strauss re: next steps; telephone call to Sam Hananel (Associated Press) and telephone call to Jeannie Perron re: same	1.50	Harris Weinstein
7/31/03	Meet with Mr. Weinstein, Mr. Gulland, and Ms. Perron to discuss case status in light of judge's denial of motion to dismiss.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
7/31/03	Prepare for and attend meeting with Harris Weinstein, Gene Gulland and Josh Wolson re next steps; conference call with Harris Weinstein, Gene Gulland, Julie Strauss re litigation.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron
Total Hours:		34.25	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$540.00	17.25	\$9,315.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	1.50	\$810.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$360.00	2.00	\$720.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$270.00	13.50	\$3,645.00
Total			34.25	\$14,490.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	94.95
Computer Research	203.28
Messengers	6.00
TOTAL	\$ 304.23

Total Fee:	\$ 14,490.00
Total Client Charges:	304.23
Total This Invoice:	\$ 14,794.23

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60309822

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER

60312191

ACCOUNT NUMBER

025557.00106

DATE

September 8, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period August 1, 2003, through August 31, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/1/03	Review right-to-sue letters and cases on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
8/1/03	Telephone calls	0.25	Harris Weinstein
8/1/03	Draft answer to second amended complaint.	5.50	Joshua Wolson
8/4/03	Draft and edit answer to second amended complaint.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
8/5/03	Review and comment on draft answer.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
8/5/03	Draft rule 26.1 corporate disclosure statement; edit answer to second amended complaint.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
8/5/03	Review and edit draft answer.	2.00	Jeannie M. Perron
8/6/03	Review draft complaint and discuss same with Josh Wolson	1.25	Harris Weinstein
8/6/03	Revise answer; meet with Mr. Weinstein to discuss answer.	2.75	Joshua Wolson
8/6/03	Review amended draft answer; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/7/03	Edit answer; phone conversation with Ms. Strauss to review answer; draft corporate disclosure statement.	3.75	Joshua Wolson
8/7/03	Draft memo to Josh Wolson re quote in complaint and other issues.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/8/03	Telephone call with Julie Strauss and Jeannie Perron	0.25	Harris Weinstein
8/8/03	Review redline of answer and Corporate Disclosures statement; telephone conference with Harris Weinstein re same.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
8/11/03	Comment on draft answer; calls with team, Jerry Sowalsky and Julie Strauss,	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60312191

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/11/03	Meeting at Feld to discuss strategy and needs for pending Rider case; review and sign Answer; telephone calls to Gene Gulland, Jeannie Perron and Josh Wolson re: foregoing	2.25	Harris Weinstein
8/11/03	Edit answer; meeting at client to discuss case strategy.	8.50	Joshua Wolson
8/11/03	Conference call with Harris Weinstein and Josh Wolson re meeting with Julie Strauss; prepare for meeting with Feld; travel to and from Feld; meeting with Julie Strauss, Harris Weinstein and Josh Wolson; conference call with Gene Gulland.	3.25	Jeannie M. Perron
8/12/03	Telephone conferences with Julie Strauss and Chester Gipson's assistant re letter closing cases.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
8/13/03	Review files on Rider from J. Perron; calls w/Wolson re: motion.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/13/03	Privilege	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
8/14/03	Privilege	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/15/03	Outline motion for summary judgment; gather and review scheduling orders from Judge Sullivan.	1.75	Joshua Wolson
8/15/03	Draft memo to team re preliminary list of witnesses and documents.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/18/03	Review cases from Wolson; outline discovery plan.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/18/03	Research and outline motion for judgment on the pleadings.	2.75	Joshua Wolson
8/19/03	Discovery plan.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
8/19/03	Research, outline, and draft motion for judgment on the pleadings.	2.75	Joshua Wolson
8/19/03	Review documents re memo on witnesses and documents; draft memo on witnesses and documents.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/20/03	Review Wolson outline for motion and confer on same.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/20/03	Edit and perform additional research for motion for judgment on the pleadings.	1.75	Joshua Wolson
8/20/03	Review draft Motion outline; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same; telephone conferences to Chester Gipson re letters re closure of investigations.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
8/21/03	Review and edit motion for judgment on the pleadings; confer w/team.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
8/21/03	Draft and edit motion for judgment on the pleadings.	2.75	Joshua Wolson
8/21/03	Review draft Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60312191

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/21/03	Review revised Motion to dismiss Second Amended Complaint; review documents re memo on witnesses and documents; edit memo on witnesses and documents.	3.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/22/03	Review right-to-sue etter cases; edit motion for judgment; discovery outline; calls to Meyer.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
8/22/03	Revise motion for judgment on the pleadings.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
8/25/03	Edit and file motion for judgment on the pleadings.	1.75	Joshua Wolson
8/27/03	Calls w/Meyer; outline positions on conference issues.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
Total Hours:		75.75	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$540.00	13.50	\$7,290.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	4.00	\$2,160.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$360.00	15.75	\$5,670.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$270.00	42.50	\$11,475.00
Total			75.75	\$26,595.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	82.20
Computer Research	488.17
Local Transportation	10.44
Travel	7.00
Telephone Calls	28.36
Couriers And Messengers	61.00
Messengers	30.00
Metered Mail	1.06
TOTAL	\$ 708.23

Total Fee:	\$ 26,595.00
Total Client Charges:	708.23
Total This Invoice:	\$ 27,303.23

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60312191

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.682.6000
FAX 202.682.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60316308
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
October 22, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period September 1, 2003, through September 30, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
9/2/03	Calls w/Meyer re: discovery and motion.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
9/2/03	Review filed Motion to Dismiss.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
9/5/03	Conference w/R. Meyer on discovery issues, etc; report to client.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
9/5/03	Preparation for meet and confer; meet and confer call with Gene Gulland and opposing counsel; follow-up.	1.25	Joshua Wolson
9/5/03	Meeting with Harris Weinstein re status of case and Gipson letter.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
9/8/03	Further consultations w/Meyer and reports on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/8/03	Litigation review Gipson correspondence and telephone call to Eugene Gulland and Jeannie Perron re: same and re: meet and confer	0.25	Harris Weinstein
9/9/03	Review Gipson letter and confer w/team on same; conference call with client on pending issues and strategy.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/9/03	Draft memo to Gene Gulland and Harris Weinstein re USDA letter.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
9/10/03	Discussion with Jeannie Perron and with her and Gene Gulland telephone call to Julie Strauss re: Gipson letter and meet and confer re: schedule	1.00	Harris Weinstein
9/10/03	Conference call with Julie Strauss, Harris Weinstein and Gene Gulland re status of case and other issues.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
9/11/03	Further consultations w/Meyer; review and comment on draft joint report.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financia

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60316308

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
9/11/03	Meet and confer phone conference with Gene Gulland and plaintiffs' counsel; follow-up meeting with Gene Gulland; revise proposed scheduling order; review opposition to motion for judgment on the pleadings.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
9/11/03	Review Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
9/12/03	Review plaintiff's opposition to motion for judgment and cited cases; discovery plan.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/12/03	Revise proposed meet and confer report.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
9/12/03	Review email from Julie Strauss re potential experts; review letter to FOIA Group; draft memo to Julie Strauss re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
9/13/03	Research and draft reply in support of motion for judgment on the pleadings.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
9/15/03	Draft reply memorandum in support of motion for judgment on the pleadings; draft and edit proposed scheduling order; phone conversation with Kathy Meyers re: proposed scheduling order.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
9/15/03	Review draft joint submission and draft reply brief.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
9/16/03	Fee discovery plan and review Wolson rely memo.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
9/16/03	Final edits to and filing of preliminary meet-and-confer report.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
9/17/03	Redraft reply memo; calls w/client and team.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
9/17/03	Edit reply in support of motion for judgment on the pleadings.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
9/19/03	Finish reply memo; prepare for hearing.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/22/03	File reply memo and prepare for hearing.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/22/03	File reply in support of motion for judgment on the pleadings; review pretrial order and dates included therein; research limits on scope of discovery imposed by right to sue letters.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
9/23/03	Prepare for and attend court conference.	3.75	Eugene D. Gulland
9/23/03	E-mail from and telephone call with Josh Wolson re: court hearing	0.25	Harris Weinstein
9/23/03	Attend status conference; draft e-mail reporting on conference.	2.25	Joshua Wolson
9/24/03	Calls w/client re: prehearing conference and case strategy; outline protective order issues.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
9/24/03	E-mails and telephone calls to Gene Gulland, Josh Wolson and Julie Strauss re: results of status conference	0.50	Harris Weinstein
9/25/03	Review ASPCA "Report" on USDA oversight of elephants; calls re: same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/26/03	Review new complaint and motion papers; calls w/team; outline responses.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
9/26/03	Research necessary showing to obtain protective order.	1.50	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60316308

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
9/29/03	Meeting w/team re: new complaint and motions, and how to respond; review protective order cases.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
9/29/03	E-mails re: discovery motion and draft answer	0.25	Harris Weinstein
9/29/03	Review new complaint and motion to resolve discovery dispute; draft answer to new complaint; research in support of motion for protective order.	7.75	Joshua Wolson
9/29/03	Telephone conference and meeting with Josh Wolson re background for answer; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
9/30/03	Review and comment on draft answer to new complaint; review statute of limitations cases.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
9/30/03	Research and draft motion for protective order.	4.75	Joshua Wolson
Total Hours:		66.50	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$540.00	26.00	\$14,040.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	2.25	\$1,215.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$360.00	3.75	\$1,350.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$270.00	34.50	\$9,315.00
Total			66.50	\$25,920.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	62.85
Computer Research	302.74
Local Transportation	16.00
Couriers And Messengers	30.00
Metered Mail	1.43
TOTAL	\$ 413.02

Total Fee:	\$ 25,920.00
Total Client Charges:	413.02
Total This Invoice:	<u>\$ 26,333.02</u>

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60316308

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy


COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER

60318322

ACCOUNT NUMBER

025557.00106

DATE

November 12, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period October 1, 2003, through October 31, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
10/1/03	Review draft protective order and comment on same.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
10/1/03	Edit Answer; research and draft motion for protective order.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
10/1/03	Review and comment on Draft Protective Order; review new Complaint and draft Answer; review Plaintiffs' Discovery Dispute Motion; Privilege <input type="text"/> Privilege <input type="text"/>	2.50	Jeannie M. Perron
10/2/03	Review motion for consolidation and hearing transcript; calls re: same.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
10/2/03	Draft response to motion to resolve discovery dispute; draft and edit protective order and motion in support thereof; edit answer; draft stipulation for extension of time; research opposition to motion for consolidation.	9.00	Joshua Wolson
10/2/03	Review and comment on Draft Protective Order; review Plaintiff's Motion to Consolidate.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
10/3/03	Review and edit draft response on discovery dispute.	3.25	Eugene D. Gulland
10/3/03	With Josh Wolson telephone call with Julie Strauss re: protective order; meeting with Josh Wolson re: tactical questions	0.75	Harris Weinstein
10/3/03	Research opposition to motion to consolidate; finalize and file stipulation extending time; revise proposed protective order	2.50	Joshua Wolson
10/3/03	Review Response to Motion to Resolve Discovery Dispute and revised Memorandum in Support of Motion for a Protective Order; telephone conference with Josh Wolson re comments.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
10/4/03	Draft response to motion to consolidate; edit protective order and response to motion to resolve discovery dispute.	4.00	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60318322

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
10/6/03	Work on protective order motion, discovery dispute memo, answer and consolidation.	4.75	Eugene D. Gulland
10/7/03	Further work on all pending pleadings.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
10/7/03	Review several draft filings; discuss same with Gene Gulland and Josh Wolson; telephone call to Julie Strauss re: same; review Ewell e-mail and telephone calls to Jeannie Perron, Gene Gulland and Julie Strauss re: same	2.25	Harris Weinstein
10/7/03	Review and edit motion for protective order, response to motion to resolve discovery dispute, and response to motion to consolidate; meet with Harris Weinstein and Gene Gulland re: same.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
10/7/03	Review Opposition to Motion to Consolidate, Memorandum in Support of Motion for Protective Order and Opposition to Discovery Dispute Motion; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same; review email from Glenn Ewell.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
10/8/03	File pending motions and memoranda, including final edits and client comment.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
10/8/03	Telephone calls and e-mails to Julie Strauss and Gene Gulland re: filings and consolidation order	0.50	Harris Weinstein
10/8/03	Edit and file answer, motion for protective order, and response to motion to resolve discovery dispute; draft motion for reconsideration of consolidation order.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
10/9/03	Telephone call to Gene Gulland and Josh Wolson re: consolidation motion rehearing	0.25	Harris Weinstein
10/10/03	Edit and file motion for reconsideration of consolidation order	1.00	Joshua Wolson
10/14/03	Review FOIA documents for Report of Investigation from Kenny case	2.25	Joshua Wolson
10/15/03	Review plaintiffs' reply memorandum re: discovery dispute.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
10/15/03	Retrieve and review plaintiffs' reply in support of motion to resolve discovery dispute.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
10/15/03	Review memo from Josh Wolson re number of pages produced in ASPCA FOI suit; telephone conference with Julie Strauss re same.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
10/16/03	Review Plaintiffs' Reply in Support of Motion to Resolve Discovery Dispute.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
10/17/03	Calls re: adjustments to procedural schedule; review and sign motion.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
10/17/03	Review page counts on documents received through FOIA lawsuit; telephone conference with Julie Strauss re same.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
10/20/03	Response to opposition on protective order.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
10/22/03	Review opposition to motion for reconsideration of consolidation order.	1.50	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60318322

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
10/24/03	Review Joint Stipulation For Enlargement Of Time and Plaintiffs' Opposition To Defendants' Motion For Reconsideration To Order Granting Plaintiffs' Motion For Consolidation.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
10/27/03	Review opposition to motion for protective order.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
10/28/03	Review draft reply re: protective order and voice mail to Josh Wolson re: same	0.25	Harris Weinstein
10/28/03	Draft reply in support of motion for protective order; draft reply in support of motion for reconsideration of consolidation order.	4.00	Joshua Wolson
10/29/03	Review and edit protective order reply; review cases.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
10/29/03	Edit reply in support of motion for protective order; draft reply in support of motion to reconsider consolidation order.	5.00	Joshua Wolson
10/30/03	Finalize and file protective order reply memo.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
10/30/03	Review reply on consolidation rehearing motion	0.25	Harris Weinstein
10/30/03	Edit reply briefs in support of motion for protective order and motion for reconsideration.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
10/30/03	Review Plaintiffs' Opposition to Motion for Protective Order and draft Reply; telephone conference with Josh Wolson re same; review draft Reply in Support of Motion for Reconsideration on Consolidation.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
10/31/03	Finalize and file memo opposing consolidation.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
Total Hours:		76.75	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	20.75	\$11,620.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	4.25	\$2,295.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	6.75	\$2,632.50
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	45.00	\$13,950.00
Total			76.75	\$30,497.50

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60318322

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	62.85
Computer Research	1,033.36
Facsimile	0.00
Fax Long Distance	0.00
Messengers	67.49
TOTAL	\$ 1,163.70

Total Fee:	\$ 30,497.50
Total Client Charges:	1,163.70
Total This Invoice:	\$ 31,661.20


COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.682.6000
FAX 202.682.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER

60322304

ACCOUNT NUMBER

025557.00106

DATE

December 18, 2003

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period November 1, 2003, through November 30, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
11/4/03	Comment on FOIA request.	0.25	Eugene D. Gulland
11/12/03	Review and comment on FOIA requests.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
11/19/03	Emails w/Wolson re: discovery schedule for cases.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
11/19/03	Determine schedule if judge rules on motions at hearing.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
11/22/03	Prepare for oral argument on all pending motions.	3.50	Eugene D. Gulland
11/24/03	Prepare for oral argument on pending motions.	4.00	Eugene D. Gulland
11/25/03	Argument on all pending motions in district court; calls and emails on same.	3.50	Eugene D. Gulland
11/25/03	Prepare for and attend motions hearing; prepare e-mail summarizing hearing; obtain and review court's order after hearing.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
11/28/03	Review order; voice mail to and discussion with Gene Gulland re: same and overall strategy	0.50	Harris Weinstein
Total Hours:		18.25	

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60322304

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	12.25	\$6,860.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	0.50	\$270.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	5.50	\$1,705.00
Total			18.25	\$8,835.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	20.10
Telephone Calls	3.56
TOTAL	\$ 23.66

Total Fee:	\$ 8,835.00
Total Client Charges:	23.66
Total This Invoice:	\$ 8,858.66

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60322304

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60325298
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
January 22, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period December 1, 2003, through December 31, 2003, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
11/26/03	Calls w/team and client; outline expert and case preparation plan; review order.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
12/1/03	Review and edit proposed stipulation.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
12/1/03	Draft stipulation setting discovery schedule.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
12/2/03	Emails and conference call on identifying experts.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
12/2/03	Review transcript of Tom Rider speech to UCLA in 2002; draft memo to Julie Strauss re expert witnesses.	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
12/3/03	Edit scheduling stipulation and send same to plaintiffs' counsel.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
12/5/03	Research scope of and begin drafting initial disclosures.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
12/5/03	Telephone conference with Julie Strauss re expert witnesses; draft memo to Gene Gulland re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
12/9/03	Review complaint and answer to determine what documents are needed for initial disclosures.	4.00	Joshua Wolson
12/12/03	Work on initial disclosures, including emails and meetings w/team.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
12/12/03	Revise and draft e-mail relating to chart of documents needed for initial disclosures.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
12/12/03	Review draft list of initial disclosure documents against Complaint and Answer; telephone conferences with Josh Wolson re same; review memo from Josh Wolson to Julie Strauss and revised list of initial disclosure documents; send memo to FOIA Group re status of March 2003 FOIA request.	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
12/15/03	Review documents obtained through FOIA for initial disclosures; phone conversation with Julie Strauss re: initial disclosures.	6.00	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60325298

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
12/16/03	Initial disclosure and expert matters.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
12/17/03	Watch half of video	0.50	Harris Weinstein
12/17/03	Review documents obtained through FOIA request and documents relating to Doc and Angelica investigation for initial disclosures.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
12/17/03	Draft memo to Julie Strauss re list of expert witnesses.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
12/23/03	Review expert list and search interest on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
12/30/03	Further due diligence on experts.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
12/30/03	Meet with Beth Crosby to discuss case and initial assignment to prepare initial disclosures.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
12/30/03	Meeting with Joshua Wolson & reviewing materials	0.50	Elizabeth Crosby
Total Hours:		31.75	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	7.25	\$4,060.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	0.50	\$270.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	3.25	\$1,267.50
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	20.25	\$6,277.50
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	0.50	\$80.00
Total			31.75	\$11,955.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	21.60
Local Transportation	7.00
Depositions & Transcripts	92.40
Messengers	12.69
TOTAL	\$ 133.69

Total Fee:	\$ 11,955.00
Total Client Charges:	133.69
Total This Invoice:	\$ 12,088.69

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60325298

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
 WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
 TEL 202.662.6000
 FAX 202.662.6281
 WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
 NEW YORK
 LONDON
 BRUSSELS
 SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
 60328181
 ACCOUNT NUMBER
 025557.00106
 DATE
 February 23, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.**ASPCA/Rider Litigation**

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period January 1, 2004, through January 31, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
1/5/04	Calls and emails re: experts and discovery disclosures.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
1/6/04	Review documents for initial disclosures.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
1/7/04	Meeting with Josh Wolson re documents for initial disclosure; review file lists for Feld re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
1/8/04	Travel to client's office and review client's files for initial disclosures.	3.75	Joshua Wolson
1/8/04	Accompanied Josh Wolson to Feld Entertainment to assist with discovery	4.50	Elizabeth Crosby
1/12/04	Discovery matters, experts, and Tampa Tribune article.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
1/14/04	Watch videotape	0.75	Harris Weinstein
1/15/04	Review documents for use in initial disclosures.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
1/16/04	Review documents for inclusion with initial disclosures.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
1/19/04	Review initial disclosures and documents to be produced; read Ted Friend report.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
1/20/04	Review documents for initial disclosures; review notes of past interviews with possible witnesses.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
1/21/04	Meet with Jeannie Perron to discuss possible supporting witnesses in case; review and revise initial disclosure document.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
1/21/04	Meeting with Josh Wolson re initial disclosures.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60328181

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
1/22/04	Review videos of Benjamin's death, Doc & Angelica, Blue Unit inspection, exhibit to notice of intent to sue letter, and Glenn Ewell deposition; review and edit witness lists for initial disclosures; phone call with Julie Strauss re: possible witnesses.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
1/26/04	Review and edit initial disclosures; review video tapes.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
1/26/04	Review and respond to memo from Josh Wolson re use of videos; review transcripts of presentations by Tom Rider.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
1/27/04	Meet with Gene Gulland to review videos for inclusion with initial disclosures; review initial disclosure pleading.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
1/28/04	Review documents for inclusion with initial disclosures; respond to e-mails re same.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
1/29/04	Review draft disclosures and telephone call to Josh Wolson re: same	0.25	Harris Weinstein
1/29/04	Review inspection reports and elephant medical records for inclusion with initial disclosures; edit initial disclosures based on comments from Harris Weinstein and Jeannie Perron.	7.00	Joshua Wolson
1/29/04	Review draft Initial Disclosures document; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
1/30/04	Phone conference with Julie Strauss and Jeannie Perron to discuss disclosure of witnesses for initial disclosures; phone conversations with Harris Weinstein and Gene Gulland re: same; edit initial disclosures; review elephant medical files and other documents for inclusion with initial disclosures.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
1/30/04	Conference call with Josh Wolson and Julie Strauss re Initial Disclosures; review files re Kenny medical records; review initial disclosure draft.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron
Total Hours:		49.25	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	3.00	\$1,680.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	1.00	\$540.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	4.25	\$1,657.50
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	36.50	\$11,315.00
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	4.50	\$720.00
Total			49.25	\$15,912.50

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60328181

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	185.45
Computer Research	46.75
Local Transportation	18.00
TOTAL	\$ 250.20

Total Fee:	\$ 15,912.50
Total Client Charges:	250.20
Total This Invoice:	\$ 16,162.70

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60328181

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy


COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60330046
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
March 16, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period February 1, 2004, through February 29, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
1/21/04	Calls, emails and research re: medical records issue.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
1/22/04	Work on disclosures, including review of documents and confer with team.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
1/23/04	Work on initial disclosures; calls and conferences on same.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
1/27/04	Review documents and videos; work on disclosures.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
1/28/04	Work on disclosures.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
1/29/04	Work on disclosures, including review of documents.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
1/30/04	Finalize and file disclosures.	3.50	Eugene D. Gulland
2/2/04	Review plaintiffs' initial disclosures; outline potential discovery requests .	2.50	Joshua Wolson
2/3/04	Review plaintiffs' disclosures; telephone call re: same to Julie Straus, Jerry Sowalsky and Josh Wolson; voice mail to Gene Gulland re: same	1.25	Harris Weinstein
2/4/04	Draft outline of discovery requests to plaintiffs.	6.75	Joshua Wolson
2/5/04	Review plaintiffs' initial disclosures, calls and emails on same; outline discovery plan.	3.25	Eugene D. Gulland
2/5/04	Draft outline of potential discovery requests.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
2/6/04	Calls and emails re: plaintiffs' disclosures and discovery.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
2/6/04	Prepare outline of possible discovery requests.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
2/9/04	Review and comment on discovery outline; calls and conferences.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feib Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60330046

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
2/10/04	Conference call w/J. Strauss and Wolson re: disclosures and pending issues; work on discovery plan.	3.50	Eugene D. Gulland
2/10/04	Phone call with Julie Strauss and Gene Gulland to discuss possible witnesses listed in plaintiffs' initial disclosures.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
2/12/04	Discovery outline and deposition "triage" meeting.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
2/12/04	Meet with Gene Gulland, Maura Dalton, and Kim Strosnider to discuss case.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
2/12/04	Meet with E. Gulland; J. Wolson; K. Strosnider re: background on case; follow-up re: same.	0.50	Maura A. Dalton
2/17/04	Review email re: discovery requests and edit same.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
2/17/04	Review draft discovery requests; draft memo to Josh Wolson re additional suggested requests.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
2/18/04	Review and edit outline of discovery requests.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
2/19/04	Discovery plan.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
2/20/04	Meetings w/Wolson, Clark, Strosnider re: discovery issues; work on same.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
2/20/04	Meet with Gene Gulland, Maura Dalton, and Kim Strosnider to discuss case; phone calls with Julie Strauss and Jeannie Perron to discuss litigation communications firms.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
2/20/04	Meeting with J. Wolson, G. Gulland, and M. Dalton concerning upcoming discovery schedule, and preparation for same.	1.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
2/20/04	Meet with E. Gulland, J. Wolson, K. Strosnider re. background on case.	1.00	Maura A. Dalton
2/23/04	Drafting document requests; reviewing Ringling Bros. notes on individuals identified in Plaintiffs' Initial Disclosure; reviewing Ringling Bros. response to FTC complaint.	4.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
2/24/04	Meet with Maura Dalton and Kim Strosnider to discuss witnesses in plaintiffs' initial disclosures and review video tapes relevant to case.	3.25	Joshua Wolson
2/24/04	Meeting with J. Wolson and M. Dalton regarding individuals identified by plaintiffs as potential witnesses; developing plan for depositions/interviews; review of videotapes identified in defendants' initial disclosures.	4.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
2/24/04	Meet with J. Wolson, K. Strosnider re: individuals to depose; follow up re: same.	3.50	Maura A. Dalton
2/25/04	Review documents sent by clients re: Oakland Zoo and HR 2929; review trial testimony from Mark Gebel trial.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
2/25/04	Prepare chart of witnesses to depose.	1.00	Maura A. Dalton
2/25/04	Putting together witness files for Joshua Wolson	2.25	Elizabeth Crosby

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financia

F&B Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60330046

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
2/26/04	Review transcripts of testimony of Officer Williams and Inspectors Flores and Franco from Mark Gebel trial; review and edit first set of document requests to Tom Rider.	5.50	Joshua Wolson
2/26/04	Chart of witnesses to be deposed; additional background reading.	2.50	Maura A. Dalton
2/27/04	Updating witness files	1.50	Elizabeth Crosby
Total Hours:		86.50	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	31.50	\$17,640.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	1.25	\$675.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	1.00	\$390.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	31.25	\$9,687.50
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	9.25	\$2,451.25
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	8.50	\$2,252.50
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	3.75	\$600.00
Total			86.50	\$33,696.25

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	197.40
Computer Research	5.90
TOTAL	\$ 203.30

Total Fee:	\$ 33,696.25
Total Client Charges:	203.30
Total This Invoice:	<u>\$ 33,899.55</u>

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60330046

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy



1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60332543
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
April 15, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period March 1, 2004, through March 31, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
2/26/04	Discovery matters, including interrogatories.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
3/1/04	Review document requests directed to Tom Rider.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
3/1/04	Drafting and revising document requests.	2.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/1/04	Read FOIA documents; review our draft document requests.	8.00	Maura A. Dalton
3/2/04	Review FTC materials from Feld; plan deposition program.	2.25	Eugene D. Gulland
3/2/04	Review draft document requests to organizational plaintiffs.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
3/2/04	Preparation of document requests.	1.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/2/04	Read FOIA documents.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
3/3/04	Review and comment on draft witness deposition plan; calls and emails on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
3/3/04	Review and edit document requests to Tom Rider and to organizational plaintiffs.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
3/3/04	Review FOIA documents, draft email to E. Gulland re: witness breakdown.	1.00	Maura A. Dalton
3/4/04	Completion of document requests.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/5/04	Privilege	1.25	Harris Weinstein
3/5/04	Privilege	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
3/5/04	Read FOIA document, other background reading.	1.75	Maura A. Dalton
3/8/04	Privilege discovery matters.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
3/8/04	Drafting interrogatories.	1.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60332543

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
3/8/04	Read FOIA documents.	1.75	Maura A. Dalton
3/9/04	Drafting interrogatories.	2.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/9/04	Review drafts of interrogatories; read FOIA documents.	1.75	Maura A. Dalton
3/10/04	Calls w/Meyer re: discovery issues, number of depositions, and possible stipulations.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
3/11/04	Review interrogatories to Tom Rider.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
3/12/04	Comment on draft interrogatories/requests for admission.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
3/12/04	Review and revise draft interrogatories for Tom Rider.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
3/12/04	Revising interrogatories.	1.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/13/04	Review and edit interrogatories to organizational plaintiffs.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
3/14/04	Revising interrogatories.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/16/04	Drafting requests for admission; revising interrogatories.	1.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/17/04	Review interrogatories directed to organizational plaintiffs.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
3/18/04	Review draft discovery and conferences on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
3/18/04	Meet with Gene Gulland and Kim Strosnider to discuss discovery requests; edit discovery requests; discuss requests for admission with Kim Strosnider and review USDA reports of investigation.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
3/18/04	Drafting requests for admission; revising interrogatories and document requests; meeting with Mr. Gulland and Mr. Wolson on discovery issues.	6.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/19/04	Review interrogatories and document requests; meetings re: same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
3/19/04	Review and edit proposed requests for admission to plaintiffs.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
3/19/04	Revising interrogatories, document requests, and requests for admission.	1.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/22/04	Review draft RFAs, interrogatories.	1.00	Maura A. Dalton
3/23/04	Discovery matters.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
3/23/04	Review and edit interrogatories to plaintiffs; research requirement for obtaining deposition testimony from USDA officials.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
3/24/04	Review and edit draft discovery requests to plaintiffs; meet with Maura Dalton to discuss experts; review and draft e-mail regarding potential witnesses.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
3/24/04	Review and edit draft interrogatories, document requests, witness list, and cover memos.	2.00	Jeannie M. Perron
3/24/04	Meet with J. Wolson to discuss status of case and review of possible experts; follow up re: same, review FOIA documents.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
3/24/04	Expert witness research for Maura Dalton.	2.50	Carolyn B. McKelvey

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60332543

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
3/25/04	Review Wolson analysis of possible deponents and telephone call with him re: same; telephone calls with Jerry Sowalsky and R. Reynolds re: CNBC search for debater; telephone call with Gene Gulland re: latter	1.00	Harris Weinstein
3/25/04	Review discovery requests to plaintiffs; phone conversations re: same with Harris Weinstein, Gene Gulland, and Jerry Sowalsky.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
3/25/04	Review draft requests for admissions; draft memo to Josh Wolson re same.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
3/25/04	Review FOIA documents, information re: potential expert witnesses.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
3/25/04	Further expert witness research for Maura Dalton.	0.75	Carolyn B. McKelvey
3/26/04	Work on discovery.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
3/26/04	Review draft requests for admissions; telephone calls to Jerry Sowalsky, R. Reynolds re: MSNBC debate	0.75	Harris Weinstein
3/26/04	Revise discovery requests to plaintiffs; review subpoenas served on MCI Center and Madison Square Garden.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
3/26/04	Review subpoenas to MCI Center and Madison Square Garden.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
3/26/04	Review potential expert witness documents.	5.25	Maura A. Dalton
3/26/04	Further expert witness research for Maura Dalton.	2.00	Carolyn B. McKelvey
3/28/04	Telephone call to J. McManus	0.25	Harris Weinstein
3/29/04	Calls re: discovery and new subpoenas; review same.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
3/29/04	Review subpoenas and telephone call with Josh Wolson re: same	0.25	Harris Weinstein
3/29/04	Review Ted Friend report.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
3/29/04	Review documents for potential experts.	3.00	Maura A. Dalton
3/30/04	Review final discovery drafts.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
3/30/04	Revise and send discovery requests to plaintiffs.	4.00	Joshua Wolson
3/30/04	Proofreading document requests and preparing them to be served; telephone calls with M. Dalton concerning discovery requests.	1.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/30/04	Preparation for serving discovery requests; review documents re: potential experts.	4.25	Maura A. Dalton
3/31/04	Review plaintiffs' discovery requests.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
3/31/04	Review discovery requests from plaintiffs.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
3/31/04	Reviewing plaintiffs' discovery requests.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
3/31/04	Read plaintiffs' written discovery requests, research on potential experts.	7.75	Maura A. Dalton
Total Hours:		115.75	

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60332543

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	15.25	\$8,540.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	3.50	\$1,890.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	4.75	\$1,852.50
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	25.25	\$7,827.50
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	20.75	\$5,498.75
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	41.00	\$10,865.00
Carolyn B. McKelvey	Library Staff	\$120.00	5.25	\$630.00
Total			115.75	\$37,103.75

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	272.25
Computer Research	17.16
Facsimile	0.00
Fax Long Distance	0.00
Federal Express	5.24
TOTAL	\$ 294.65

Total Fee:	\$ 37,103.75
Total Client Charges:	294.65
Total This Invoice:	\$ 37,398.40

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60332543

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy


COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.682.6000
FAX 202.682.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60335794
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
May 24, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period April 1, 2004, through April 30, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
4/1/04	Review plaintiffs' discovery requests; meet with Maura Dalton and Kim Strosnider to discuss discovery requests.	2.25	Joshua Wolson
4/1/04	Review exhibit C to plaintiffs' discovery requests; telephone conference with Josh Wolson re same.	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
4/1/04	Meeting with J. Wolson and M. Dalton to discuss plaintiffs' discovery requests and responses to same.	1.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/1/04	Meet with J. Wolson, K. Strosneider re: plaintiff's written discovery; review documents re: potential experts.	4.75	Maura A. Dalton
4/2/04	Review plaintiffs' discovery requests and compare same to complaint and answer.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
4/5/04	Drafting objections and responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	1.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/7/04	Privilege	0.50	Harris Weinstein
4/8/04	Prepare for interviews with Potential and Sasha Houcke.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
4/9/04	Review draft interrogatory responses and comment on same.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/9/04	Travel to company headquarters and DC Armory; interviews with Potential and Sasha Houcke; transcribe notes of interviews.	7.50	Joshua Wolson
4/9/04	Drafting objections and responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	2.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/9/04	Read background information on potential expert witnesses.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
4/11/04	Drafting objections and responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	4.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/12/04	Further review of discovery materials.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60335794

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
4/12/04	Transcribe notes of interview with Sascha Houcke; meet with Maura Dalton and Kim Strosnider to discuss case; review draft responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
4/12/04	Drafting responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; meeting with J. Wolson and M. Dalton regarding discovery and witness interviews.	2.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/12/04	Read interview memos; meet with J. Wolson, K. Strosneider re: update.	0.75	Maura A. Dalton
4/13/04	Continuing review of discovery responses.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/13/04	Reviewing FOIA documents in order to prepare responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	2.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/15/04	Continue work on discovery; arrange attendance at animal law conference.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
4/15/04	Reviewing FOIA documents; drafting responses to plaintiffs' interrogatories.	6.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/15/04	Read Dr. Friend report re: transport of Ringling elephants. Read other materials re: other potential expert witnesses.	2.50	Maura A. Dalton
4/16/04	Further review and comment on discovery.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
4/16/04	Reviewing FOIA documents; drafting responses to plaintiffs' interrogatories; drafting email to J. Wolson and M. Dalton on discovery responses.	2.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/16/04	Read Dr. Friend report re: transport of Ringling elephants; read draft responses to written discovery.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
4/16/04	Preparing for animal rights conference; getting information from Kim Strosnider, registering, looking for information on speakers	1.50	Elizabeth Crosby
4/17/04	Attending Katherine Meyer presentations at American University animal law conference.	3.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/18/04	Reviewing Friend report on rail transport of circus elephants and drafting responses to plaintiffs' interrogatories (2 hours); drafting file memorandum on American University animal law conference (1.5 hours)	3.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/19/04	Drafting file memo on AU animal law conference; reviewing and editing paralegal memorandum on same.	3.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/19/04	Review draft discovery responses, read other expert materials.	2.75	Maura A. Dalton
4/19/04	Writing synopsis of animal rights conference	2.25	Elizabeth Crosby
4/19/04	Indexing elephants for interrogatories	5.00	Elizabeth Crosby
4/20/04	Emails re: Animal Law Conference; review discovery drafts.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
4/20/04	Review and edit draft response to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	3.00	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60335794

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
4/20/04	Meeting with J. Wolson on responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; telephone call with paralegal, B. Crosby, regarding same and regarding document production.	0.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/20/04	Read <input type="text" value="Privilege"/> (potential expert witness).	6.00	Maura A. Dalton
4/20/04	Indexing elephants for interrogatories	4.75	Elizabeth Crosby
4/21/04	Discovery matters.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
4/21/04	Revising responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	3.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/21/04	Read <input type="text" value="Privilege"/> material on other potential experts.	2.50	Maura A. Dalton
4/21/04	Updating witness files	2.50	Elizabeth Crosby
4/22/04	Review responses to discovery requests.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
4/22/04	Reviewing J. Wolson revisions to and revising responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/22/04	Expert witness background reading.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
4/23/04	Review and comment on discovery responses.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
4/23/04	Review responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; prepare e-mail summarizing information needed from client.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
4/23/04	Revising responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; telephone call with J. Wolson on same and on plaintiffs' subpoenas to third parties; drafting email regarding information to be gathered by client for discovery responses.	1.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
4/26/04	Phone conversations to work out extension of discovery deadline.	0.50	Joshua Wolson
4/26/04	Looking through FOIA documents	2.00	Elizabeth Crosby
4/27/04	Expert witness reading.	4.00	Maura A. Dalton
4/28/04	Discovery matters, including stipulation re: new schedule.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
4/28/04	Phone conversation with Julie Strauss and counsel for MCI Center to discuss pending subpoena.	0.50	Joshua Wolson
4/28/04	Expert witness reading.	8.00	Maura A. Dalton
4/30/04	Review draft discovery and notes on expert witness candidates.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
Total Hours:		127.50	

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60335794

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	10.75	\$6,020.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	0.50	\$270.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	1.25	\$487.50
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	22.75	\$7,052.50
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	38.00	\$10,070.00
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	36.25	\$9,606.25
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	18.00	\$2,880.00
Total			127.50	\$36,386.25

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	904.95
Computer Research	93.63
Parking	13.00
Facsimile	0.00
Fax Long Distance	0.00
Federal Express	8.86
TOTAL	\$ 1,020.44

Total Fee:	\$ 36,386.25
Total Client Charges:	1,020.44
Total This Invoice:	\$ 37,406.69

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60335794

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
 WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
 TEL 202.682.6000
 FAX 202.682.6291
 WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
 NEW YORK
 LONDON
 BRUSSELS
 SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
 60337347
 ACCOUNT NUMBER
 025557.00106
 DATE
 June 11, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period May 1, 2004, through May 31, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/3/04	Read background information on experts.	3.75	Maura A. Dalton
5/4/04	Conversations with Maura Dalton and Gene Gulland about experts.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
5/4/04	Meeting with Maura Dalton re experts.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
5/4/04	Meet with J. Perron re: expert witnesses; phone call with J. Wolson re: same, preparation for meeting; begin research on CBW exception.	4.00	Maura A. Dalton
5/5/04	Conversations with Maura Dalton and Gene Gulland about experts.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
5/5/04	Research re violations of the AWA.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
5/6/04	Discovery matters; review memos re: violations of AWA.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
5/6/04	Interview individuals listed on plaintiffs' initial disclosures.	8.00	Joshua Wolson
5/6/04	Draft memo to Julie Straus re AWA violation issue.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
5/7/04	Discovery issues; review subpoenas to Madison Square Garden and calls on same.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
5/7/04	Discussion with Jeannie Perron; telephone call with Josh Wolson re: Providence interviews	0.50	Harris Weinstein
5/7/04	Review motion to compel filed against MCI Center; review notes of witness interviews; meet with Kim Strosnider to discuss discovery.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
'7/04	Telephone conference with Josh Wolson re experts.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron

ON LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60337347

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/7/04	Meeting with J. Wolson on discovery issues; revising responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests and drafting email to J. Strauss on same; researching time for third party's response to motion to compel and drafting email to J. Wolson on same; beginning review of FOIA documents for responsiveness to plaintiffs' document requests.	4.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/7/04	Discuss status of the case and interviews with Blue Unit with J. Wolson; review correspondence of plaintiffs.	0.50	Maura A. Dalton
5/10/04	Emails re: AWA issue and use of the "an kus " response.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
5/10/04	Review letter from Kathy Myers to Madison Square Garden re subpoena.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
5/11/04	Phone conversations with Julie Strauss and Jacques Smith re: MCI center subpoena; prepare for interviews with Gary Jacobson and Potential	2.00	Joshua Wolson
5/11/04	Review memo from Julie Strauss re violations of AWA, draft memo to Julie Strauss re same.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
5/12/04	Travel to and tour CEC and interview Gary Jacobson and Pote Potential	13.00	Joshua Wolson
5/13/04	Phone conversations with Julie Strauss and Jacques Smith re: pending subpoena; draft e-mail to client regarding upcoming projects; review letter sent by plaintiffs' counsel to counsel for MCI Center.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
5/13/04	Telephone call and emails with J. Wolson concerning discovery issues; reviewing FOIA documents for responsiveness to plaintiffs' document requests.	2.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/14/04	Review video tapes of Ringling Bros. at MCI Center; phone conversations with Julie Strauss, Jacques Smith, and Gary Kolker to discuss pending motion to compel.	5.00	Joshua Wolson
5/14/04	Reviewing plaintiffs' third-party motion to compel and related correspondence.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/14/04	Assisting Josh Wolson with viewing security tapes of circus at the MCI Center	4.75	Elizabeth Crosby
5/17/04	Calls and emails re: criteria for selection of experts and interviews of same.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
5/17/04	Review responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; draft outline of subpoenas.	5.50	Joshua Wolson
5/17/04	Reviewing FOIA documents for responsiveness to plaintiffs' document requests; telephone call and emails with J. Wolson and B. Crosby (paralegal) regarding discovery issues.	2.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/18/04	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Julie Strauss, Gary Jacobson and Maura Dalton re experts.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financia

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60337347

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/18/04	Reviewing FOIA documents for responsiveness to plaintiffs' document requests; drafting email to J. Wolson on defendants' document production.	3.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/18/04	Phone call with J. Perron, J. Strauss re: experts; preparation for meeting.	1.25	Maura A. Dalton
5/19/04	Review discovery responses; meet with Kim Strosnider to discuss the same; review correspondence sent regarding subpoena to MCI Center.	1.75	Joshua Wolson
5/19/04	Review correspondence re subpoena to Washington Sports Arena.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
5/19/04	Revising defendants' responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; conferring with J. Wolson on same.	4.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/20/04	Detailed edit of discovery responses and meeting with team to discuss.	5.75	Eugene D. Gulland
5/20/04	Review discovery responses; meet with Gene Gulland, Jeannie Perron, Kim Strosnider, and Maura Dalton to discuss discovery responses; transcribe notes of interview with Gary Jacobsen into file memo.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
5/20/04	Review draft responses to discovery requests, attend meeting with team re same.	3.50	Jeannie M. Perron
5/20/04	Revising defendants' responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; meeting with paralegal, B. Crosby, about document production; meeting with G. Gulland, J. Wolson, J. Perron, and M. Dalton regarding responses to interrogatories and document requests.	3.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/20/04	Meet with E. Gulland; J. Perron, J. Wolson, K. Strosnider re: written discovery, read pleadings re: compelling MCI center to produce video.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
5/21/04	Further discovery work; review memos re: expert witness candidates; review motion to compel Madison S.G.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
5/21/04	Telephone conference with Julie Strauss, Marigold Gerstein, and Kim Strosnider to discuss discovery responses; review discovery responses; phone conversations with counsel for MCI Center.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
5/21/04	Draft memo to Gene Gulland and team re expert witnesses.	2.00	Jeannie M. Perron
5/21/04	Revising and completing defendants' responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; teleconference on same with J. Wolson, J. Strauss, and L. Gerstein.	6.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/21/04	Read memo re: G. Jacobson interview.	0.25	Maura A. Dalton
5/21/04	Assisting with document production	2.50	Elizabeth Crosby
5/22/04	Review of memos on experts and G. Jacobson interview; review of media training packet for material relevant to interrogatory responses.	1.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/23/04	Revising responses to plaintiffs' interrogatories.	2.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60337347

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/24/04	Further work on discovery responses and review ankus training materials.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
5/24/04	Review proposed discovery responses; review plaintiffs' motion to compel filed against Madison Square Garden; phone conversation with counsel for Madison Square Garden.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
5/24/04	Draft memo to Julie Strauss re experts.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
5/24/04	Revising responses to plaintiffs' interrogatories, and telephone calls with J. Wolson on same; meetings with paralegal concerning document production; reviewing documents and videotapes in Covington & Burling files for responsiveness to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	6.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/24/04	CBW/Takings research, review latest draft of discovery responses.	5.00	Maura A. Dalton
5/24/04	Assisting Kim Strosnider with document production	5.00	Elizabeth Crosby
5/25/04	Review of further discovery responses and key documents.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
5/25/04	Phone conferences with Potential [redacted] and Potential [redacted] to discuss discovery responses.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
5/25/04	Research re location of potential expert Potential Witness [redacted]	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
5/25/04	Revising interrogatory responses; teleconference with J. Strauss, G. Jacobson, and J. Wolson; teleconference with J. Strauss, D. Fahrenbruck, and J. Wolson; reviewing documents for privilege and responsiveness in preparation for document production.	6.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/25/04	Research plaintiffs' claims regarding the "captive breed wildlife" exception to the endangered species act.	8.00	Maura A. Dalton
5/25/04	Assisting Kim Strosnider with document production	5.50	Elizabeth Crosby
5/26/04	Discovery responses and review sensitive documents.	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
5/26/04	Review draft discovery responses; telephone call with Josh Wolson re: same	0.75	Harris Weinstein
5/26/04	Telephone conference with Julie Strauss re contacts with experts, review memo re interview with Gary Jacobson.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
5/26/04	Telephone call with L. Gerstein regarding Wonder Dust for purposes of drafting interrogatory response; reviewing videotape for possible production.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/26/04	Phone call re: DC OIG production, edits to confidentiality agreement.	6.00	Maura A. Dalton
5/26/04	Assisting Kim Strosnider with document production	4.00	Elizabeth Crosby
5/27/04	Calls re: experts; continue review of sensitive documents and discovery responses.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60337347

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/27/04	Witness interview summaries for Potential Geoff Pettigrew, and Potential review responses to discovery requests; meet with Abe George to discuss summer associate research assignment; phone conversation with Hal Widenfeld re: motion to compel pending against Madison Square Garden.	4.00	Joshua Wolson
5/27/04	Telephone conference with Potential re Wonder Dust, telephone conference with Gene Gulland re expert issues, telephone conferences with Ted Friend, Potential Dennis Schmidt and the Potential Witness draft memos to Julie Strauss re same, conference call with Dennis Schmidt and Maura Dalton re serving as an expert witness and re background.	2.50	Jeannie M. Perron
5/27/04	Reviewing emails from Feld personnel on topical treatments for elephants; revising discovery request responses; reviewing documents to be produced for relevance and privilege.	2.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
5/27/04	Phone call with D. Schmidt, draft memo re: call, CBW/Taking research.	5.50	Maura A. Dalton
5/27/04	Working on witness files	4.50	Elizabeth Crosby
5/27/04	Meet with Gene Gulland and Josh Wolson on Ringling Bros. and Barnum & Bailey Circus matter.	1.00	Abraham George
5/28/04	Witness interview memos and telephone calls to Josh Wolson re: same	0.75	Harris Weinstein
5/28/04	Prepare for call with Potential gather and send cases to counsel for Madison Square Garden.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
5/28/04	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Ted Friend and Maura Dalton re Friend as expert witness, research re contact information for Potential Witness	2.25	Jeannie M. Perron
5/28/04	Phone call with T. Friend, J. Perron re: expert testimony; draft memo re: same; CBW/Takings research.	5.00	Maura A. Dalton
5/28/04	Going through FOIA documents for Jeannie Perron	4.25	Elizabeth Crosby
5/28/04	Ringling Brother's research.	2.00	Abraham George
Total Hours:		217.25	

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60337347

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	19.50	\$10,920.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	2.00	\$1,080.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	17.50	\$6,825.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	59.25	\$18,367.50
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	44.25	\$11,726.25
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	41.25	\$10,931.25
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	30.50	\$4,880.00
Abraham George	Summer Assoc.	\$180.00	3.00	\$540.00
Total			217.25	\$65,270.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Scanning	0.15
Duplicating	361.05
Computer Research	23.58
Business Meals	5.33
Facsimile	0.00
Long Distance Calls	31.50
Travel	291.80
Air Rail Travel	176.60
Meetings & Seminars	50.00
Fax Long Distance	0.00
TOTAL	\$ 940.01

Total Fee:	\$ 65,270.00
Total Client Charges:	940.01
Total This Invoice:	<u>\$ 66,210.01</u>

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60337347

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60340802
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
July 23, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period June 1, 2004, through June 30, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
5/28/04	Confer with potential experts; review draft discovery.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/1/04	Phone conversations with Harris Weinstein and with counsel for MCI Center to discuss pending motions to compel; watch videos of animal handler training for production in discovery.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
6/1/04	Reviewing videotapes for responsiveness to plaintiffs' discovery requests and for privilege; discussing same with J. Wolson; attending D.C. Bar conference on animal law featuring presentation by Meyer & Glitzenstein attorney.	4.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/2/04	Madison Square Garden issues and call w/H. Weinstein on same; discovery issues re: videotape by Feld.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/2/04	Telephone call with Gene Gulland re: discovery matters	0.25	Harris Weinstein
6/2/04	Phone call with Julie Strauss, Kim Strosnider, and Deb Fahrenbruck to discuss interrogatory responses; edit responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
6/2/04	Research re location of <input type="text" value="Potential Witness"/> draft memo to C&B London office re same.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
6/2/04	Meeting with J. Wolson on discovery responses; teleconference with J. Strauss and <input type="text" value="Potential"/> on same; revising discovery responses.	2.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/2/04	Draft interview memos; review T. Friend activities.	5.50	Maura A. Dalton
6/3/04	Review draft letters to potential experts; review Feld videos.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/3/04	Review and edit draft discovery responses; review documents for production; review proposed confidentiality order for MCI Center production.	1.50	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/3/04	Review memo from Julie Strauss re draft letter to expert, draft memos to Gene Gulland and Julie Strauss re same, telephone conference with Potential	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
6/3/04	Read discovery response draft, proposed confidentiality agreement from WSE.	1.00	Maura A. Dalton
6/4/04	Review draft discovery answers and proposed MCI confidentiality agreement.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/4/04	Review response to discovery requests.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
6/4/04	Reviewing and revising responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests.	1.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/4/04	Read T. Friend publications.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
6/4/04	Research into Potential Witness	4.00	Yuung Yuung Yap
6/5/04	Reviewing documents for privilege and responsiveness to plaintiffs' discovery requests; drafting emails to G. Gulland and J. Perron regarding videotape production; revising interrogatory responses; drafting email to J. Strauss, L. Gerstein, and K. Jones regarding open questions on discovery responses; reviewing plaintiffs' third-party discovery motion and related correspondence.	5.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/7/04	Discovery responses; review expert CV's and interview memoranda.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/7/04	Phone conferences with Julie Strauss to discuss responses to discovery requests; edit same.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
6/7/04	Telephone calls with Dr. Perron and Ms. Yap regarding expert.	0.50	Patricia Ponsonby
6/7/04	Edit report on Ted Friend and Dennis Schmidt, telephone conference with Patricia Ponsonby and Gene Gulland re Potential Potential Witness	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
6/7/04	Reviewing videotapes and documents for responsiveness to plaintiffs' discovery requests and privilege; revising responses to plaintiffs' discovery requests; meeting with paralegal, B. Crosby, on document production issues and drafting and responding to emails on same; meeting with J. Wolson on discovery and document production issues; drafting email about D.C. Bar Animal Law Conference; reviewing report regarding interviews with prospective expert witnesses.	7.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/7/04	Revise expert memo.	0.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/7/04	Assisting Josh Wolson & Kim Strosnider with document production	6.50	Elizabeth Crosby
6/7/04	Research into Potential Witness	4.00	Yuung Yuung Yap
6/8/04	Review Feld videotapes; edit responses.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/8/04	Meetings with Andy Lamb and Kim Hoffmaster and Tim Clinton to discuss summer associate assignments (1 hour); review and edit discovery responses; phone conversations with Potential Witness	3.50	Joshua Wolson
6/8/04	Draft letter to Potential re contacting Potential Witness Potential review memos from Julie Strauss re experts, review draft responses to discovery requests, telephone conference with Josh Wolson re same.	2.00	Jeannie M. Perron
6/8/04	Reviewing videotapes and documents for responsiveness to plaintiffs' discovery requests and for privilege; meetings with paralegal, B. Crosby, regarding document production; emails and telephone calls with J. Wolson regarding document production issues.	5.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/8/04	Assisting Josh Wolson & Kim Strosnider with document production	6.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/9/04	Final work on discovery responses; review plaintiff responses.	3.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/9/04	Review documents for production; review plaintiffs' discovery responses; finalize responses to discovery requests; phone conversations with Julie Strauss and Potential to discuss certifications.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
6/9/04	Telephone conference with Josh Wolson re responses to interrogatories, telephone conference with Potential Witness re being expert witness, review material re payments to experts	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/9/04	Document production.	5.50	Patricia D. Johnson
6/9/04	Proofreading discovery responses and discussing same with J. Wolson; organizing and coordinating document production work.	1.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/9/04	Additional reading on experts, review payments to experts, draft e-mail to Potential Witness	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
6/9/04	Assisted Josh Wolson & Kim Strosnider with document production	8.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/10/04	Prepare for and participate in status hearing.	3.00	Eugene D. Gulland
6/10/04	Work on document production including redacting information	5.00	Ann Homan
6/10/04	Prepare for and attend status conference; prepare and send document production to plaintiffs; obtain certifications from Deb Fahrenbruck and Alex Vargas.	4.50	Joshua Wolson
6/10/04	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Dr. Murray Fowler and Maura Dalton re acting as expert witness, draft memos to Maura Dalton re related expert issues.	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/10/04	Document production.	7.50	Patricia D. Johnson
6/10/04	Organizing and arranging for document and videotape production; drafting privilege log.	4.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/10/04	Phone interview with Potential J. Perron, memo re: same; review Feld payments to experts.	7.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/10/04	Assisting Josh Wolson & Kim Strosnider with document production	12.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/11/04	Review plaintiffs' discovery responses; interview experts.	3.25	Eugene D. Gulland
6/11/04	Redacting train documents for Feld document production	2.25	Ann Homan
6/11/04	Review plaintiffs' discovery responses; meet with Maura Dalton and Kim Strosnider to discuss discovery responses and document review; produce documents and videos to plaintiffs.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
6/11/04	Meeting with Harris Weinstein re plaintiffs' interrogatory responses, edit draft Potent interview summary, meeting with Maura Dalton re same, draft letter to Potential Witness Potential Witness	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/11/04	Document production.	1.00	Patricia D. Johnson
6/11/04	Meeting with J. Wolson and M. Dalton regarding document review and plaintiffs' discovery responses; meeting with paralegal on follow-up document and videotape production; reviewing redacted documents to be produced.	2.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/11/04	Meet with J. Wolson, K. Strosneider; read additional articles sent by T. Friend, follow up phone call with Potential draft cover letters to Potential T. Friend, and D. Schmitt.	7.50	Maura A. Dalton
6/11/04	Assisting Josh Wolson & Kim Strosnider with document production	4.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/11/04	Reviewed Selected Train Schedules in Spanish	0.75	Jadranka Poljak
6/14/04	Interviews w/experts.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
6/14/04	Phone conversations with Hal Widenfeld and Scott Ward to discuss pending subpoenas and motions to compel; review and index document productions of Tom Rider and ASPCA; meet with Andy Lamb to discuss summer associate project.	6.50	Joshua Wolson
6/14/04	Reviewing plaintiffs' discovery responses; discussing assignments on same with paralegal, B. Crosby.	2.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/14/04	Document review, read Potential publications.	7.75	Maura A. Dalton
6/14/04	Working on Rider media chart for Kim Strosnider	3.75	Elizabeth Crosby
6/14/04	Researching endangered species for A. Lamb.	0.50	Elena Howell
6/15/04	Consider Madison Square Garden discovery; e-mails with Josh Wolson and Gene Gulland re same	0.25	Harris Weinstein
6/15/04	Review documents from Fund for Animals' production.	4.00	Joshua Wolson
6/15/04	Draft memos to and telephone conference with Maura Dalton re expert issues.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/15/04	Reviewing documents produced by the Animal Welfare Institute.	2.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/15/04	Document review.	8.50	Maura A. Dalton
6/15/04	Working on Rider media chart for Kim Strosnider	4.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/16/04	Review Sullivan orders in new ESA decision.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/16/04	Prepare for and conference call with Potential Witness Potential telephone conference with Potential	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
6/16/04	Reviewing documents produced by AWI.	5.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/16/04	Document review, phone interview with Potential Witness re: expert testimony; memo re: same.	8.00	Maura A. Dalton
6/16/04	Working on Rider media chart for Kim Strosnider	1.50	Elizabeth Crosby
6/16/04	Working on Rider alleged abuse chart for Kim Strosnider	2.50	Elizabeth Crosby
6/17/04	Expert interviews and review plaintiff documents.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
6/17/04	Review memo from Potential Witness draft memo to Maura Dalton re same, review and edit draft summary of interview with Potential Witness prepare for and participate in conference call with Potential and Maura Dalton re expert witness, meeting with Maura Dalton re same, telephone conference with Tom Albert re Gary and Keri Johnson as experts.	2.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/17/04	Reviewing documents produced by AWI.	2.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/17/04	Document review, phone interview w/Potenti; draft memo re: same.	6.00	Maura A. Dalton
6/17/04	Working on Rider alleged abuse chart for Kim Strosnider	4.50	Elizabeth Crosby
6/18/04	Review videos.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
6/18/04	Review documents produced by FFA.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
6/18/04	Review of documents produced by AWI; drafting email to M. Dalton and J. Wolson on same.	3.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/18/04	Document review, Potenti interview memo.	8.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/18/04	Working on Rider alleged abuse chart for Kim Strosnider	4.25	Elizabeth Crosby
6/20/04	Review documents produced by FFA.	3.00	Joshua Wolson
6/21/04	Review statute of limitations memo and cited authorities; review plaintiffs' documents.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
6/21/04	Review memo on applicable statute of limitations; review plaintiffs' discovery responses for missing information; phone conversations with Matt Watkins re: hearing in SDNY on motion to compel MSG; review documents produced by FFA.	5.50	Joshua Wolson
6/21/04	Telephone conference with and prepare for and participate in conferece call with Keri Johnson and Maura Dalton re possibly acting as expert witness.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/21/04	Interview with Kari Johnson; draft memo re: same; document review.	7.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/21/04	Conferred with Wolson re attending motion to compel hearing between plaintiffs and MSG; reviewed pleadings re same.	1.50	Matthew J. Watkins
6/21/04	Working on Rider media chart for Kim Strosnider	4.25	Elizabeth Crosby
6/21/04	Working on plaintiff's addendum chart	2.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/22/04	Expert witness interviews; review statute of limitation memo and cases.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
6/22/04	Review significant documents; e-mails regarding motion to compel filed against Madison Square Garden; review plaintiffs' discovery responses for possible omissions.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
6/22/04	Review and edit draft letter from Maura Dalton to experts enclosing complaint and answer, review and edit draft report on Potential and Keri Johnson.	1.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/22/04	Draft letters to experts, revise memo.	5.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/22/04	Attended motion to compel hearing between plaintiffs and MSG and emailed Wolson re same.	2.50	Matthew J. Watkins
6/22/04	Working on plaintiff's addendum chart	4.25	Elizabeth Crosby
6/23/04	Prepare list of subpoena candidates.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
6/23/04	Telephone conference with Potential review plaintiffs' discovery responses.	2.75	Jeannie M. Perron
6/23/04	Review list of subpoena candidates, document review, read expert materials.	5.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/23/04	Working on plaintiff's addendum chart	3.00	Elizabeth Crosby
6/24/04	Prepare for and conference call with Potential Witness and Maura Dalton, conference call with Maura Dalton and Gene Gulland re experts, draft memo to Maura Dalton re memo to Potential Potential review file re Potential Witness telephone conference with Julie Strauss' secretary re same.	2.00	Jeannie M. Perron
6/24/04	Phone call with J. Perron and E. Gulland re: experts, phone interview with Potential potential expert from India, follow up e-mail and letter to Potential draft memo re: interview.	7.50	Maura A. Dalton
6/24/04	Working on plaintiff's addendum chart	3.50	Elizabeth Crosby
6/25/04	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Gene Gulland, Maura Dalton and Dennis Schmidt re his expert testimony, edit draft summary of conversation with Potential	2.25	Jeannie M. Perron
6/25/04	Reviewing reports of interviews with expert witnesses; reviewing and preparing detailed log of AWI document production.	0.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/25/04	Review final draft of Feld written discovery, revise interview memos, additional expert reading.	6.75	Maura A. Dalton
6/25/04	Working on plaintiff's addendum chart	3.75	Elizabeth Crosby
6/27/04	Review memoranda of interviews with potential experts.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
6/28/04	Review memorandum on availability of suit under ESA for violations of AWA and preclusive effect of government investigatory findings; review memorandum on admissibility of documents included in plaintiffs "report" on government; prepare chart of possible subpoena candidates; review stipulation between Madison Square Garden and plaintiffs; meet with Margaret Burton, Kim Strosnider, and Maura Dalton to discuss pending projects	5.00	Joshua Wolson
6/28/04	Draft memo for Julie Strauss re interviews with expert witnesses, Telephone conference with with Julie Strauss re summary of status on retention of experts and strategy with respect to Potential [redacted] Potential [redacted] conference call with Julie Strauss and Potential [redacted] re potential experts, draft memo to Gene Gulland and Maura Dalton re information from Potential [redacted] on potential experts.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron
6/28/04	Reviewing draft list of subpoenas to be served and drafting email to J. Wolson on same; meeting with J. Wolson, M. Dalton, and new paralegal regarding status of the case.	0.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
6/28/04	Letters to experts, schedule follow up interviews with K. Johnson, Potential [redacted] draft interview memos; document review; meet with J. Wolson, K. Strosnider, M. Burton.	5.00	Maura A. Dalton
6/28/04	Meeting with Mr. Wolson, Ms. Dalton, and Ms. Strosnider to discuss the background of case. Initial review of background documents.	2.00	Margaret R. Burton
6/29/04	Interview calls w/experts; review proposed discovery agreements.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
6/29/04	Review draft discovery deposition plan and telephone call with Gene Gulland re: same	1.50	Harris Weinstein
6/29/04	Review memoranda on hearsay implications of plaintiffs' "report" on APHIS-Ringling Bros. contacts and on admissibility of evidence of events predating statute of limitations.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
6/29/04	Review MSG stipulation with plaintiffs and list of parties to be subpoenaed, prepare for and participate in conference calls with Ted Friend and Potential Witness [redacted]	3.00	Jeannie M. Perron
6/29/04	Follow up interview with T. Friend, Potential [redacted] interview memos re: same.	4.25	Maura A. Dalton
6/29/04	Updating witness files	3.25	Elizabeth Crosby
6/29/04	Meeting with Ms. Crosby. Introduction to her duties for the case.	1.25	Margaret R. Burton
6/30/04	Review proposed WSE confidentiality agreement and e-mail re: same	0.50	Harris Weinstein

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial [redacted]

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60340802

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/30/04	Review stipulations from motions to compel MSG and MCI Center to produce security tapes.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
6/30/04	Privilege	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
6/30/04	Updating addendum index	1.75	Elizabeth Crosby
6/30/04	Meeting with Ms. Crosby. Introduction to existing case indexes.	1.25	Margaret R. Burton
Total Hours:		395.00	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	26.75	\$14,980.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	2.50	\$1,350.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	26.25	\$10,237.50
Patricia Ponsonby	Associate	\$420.00	0.50	\$210.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	61.00	\$18,910.00
Matthew J. Watkins	Associate	\$310.00	4.00	\$1,240.00
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	51.00	\$13,515.00
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	105.25	\$27,891.25
Ann Homan	Paralegal Spec.	\$185.00	7.25	\$1,341.25
Yuung Yuung Yap	Paralegal	\$185.00	8.00	\$1,480.00
Patricia D. Johnson	Paralegal	\$180.00	14.00	\$2,520.00
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	82.75	\$13,240.00
Jadranka Poljak	Paralegal	\$150.00	0.75	\$112.50
Margaret R. Burton	Paralegal	\$150.00	4.50	\$675.00
Elena Howell	Library Staff	\$100.00	0.50	\$50.00
Total			395.00	\$107,752.50

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	2,010.35
Computer Research	10.26
Local Transportation	32.75

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

• **Feld Entertainment, Inc.**
 • ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 • 025557.00106
 • Invoice No.: 60340802
 •

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Overtime Transportation	18.58
Long Distance Calls	116.19
Telephone Calls	84.62
Outside Library Services	105.95
Messengers	59.94
Metered Mail	5.25
TOTAL	\$ 2,443.89

Total Fee:	\$ 107,752.50
Total Client Charges:	2,443.89
Total This Invoice:	\$ 110,196.39

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

• **Feld Entertainment, Inc.**
• ASPCA/Rider Litigation
• 025557.00106
• Invoice No.: 60340802
•

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy


COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.662.6000
FAX 202.662.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER

60343623

ACCOUNT NUMBER

025557.00106

DATE

August 25, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period July 1, 2004, through July 31, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
6/14/04	Review files re expert agreements, send agreements to Maura Dalton, draft memos and telephone conference with Maura Dalton re scheduling additional witness interviews, draft memo to <u>Potenti</u> <u>Potential Witness</u> re scheduling.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
7/1/04	Expert interviews (<u>Pote</u> Johnson), and memo on same.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/1/04	Telephone call from Jerry Sowalsky and Julie Strauss; e-mail to Josh Wolson re: same	0.50	Harris Weinstein
7/1/04	Review memos re agreement with WSC, prepare for and participate in conference call with Kari Johnson, meeting with Gene Gulland and Maura Dalton re same, telephone conference with Julie Strauss re same, review draft Schmidt witness interview.	3.50	Jeannie M. Perron
7/1/04	Follow up interview with K. Johnson; phone call with <u>Potenti</u> re: follow up interview.	1.25	Maura A. Dalton
7/1/04	Indexing Feld production	3.00	Elizabeth Crosby
7/1/04	Searching official internet sites for Feld Entertainment, Animal Welfare Institute, The Fund for Animals, and the Animal Welfare Institute. Started Feld Entertainment's Document Production Index with Ms. Crosby.	4.50	Margaret R. Burton
7/2/04	Review proposed agreement settling motion to compel against MCI Center.	2.00	Joshua Wolson
7/2/04	Review <u>Potential Witness</u> book by <u>Potential Witness</u> <u>Potential</u> telephone conference with Julie Strauss re expert issues.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
7/2/04	Draft interview memos, additional expert reading.	4.00	Maura A. Dalton

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/2/04	Organizing & updating witness files	3.50	Elizabeth Crosby
7/2/04	Researching contact information for M. Dalton.	0.25	Elena Howell
7/2/04	Continuation of the Feld Entertainment's Document Production Index.	4.25	Margaret R. Burton
7/6/04	Expert interviews.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/6/04	Phone conversations with Scott Ward (counsel for MCI Center) and Julie Strauss to discuss agreement resolving motion to compel MCI Center.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
7/6/04	Draft memos to Gene Gulland and Maura Dalton re status of experts.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
7/6/04	Continuation of index	6.50	Margaret R. Burton
7/7/04	Telephone interview w/Potential review discovery documents.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
7/7/04	Telephone conference with Maura Dalton re expert issues, telephone conference with Julie Strauss re Potential telephone conference with Potential draft memo to Gene Gulland, Julie Straus and Maura Dalton re Potential and other experts she recommended, edit draft agreement for Ted Friend.	1.50	Jeannie M. Perron
7/7/04	Draft interview memos, retainer letters for experts, document review.	4.00	Maura A. Dalton
7/7/04	Touched base with Ms. Crosby about the Production Index. Continued to enter items into index. Spoke with Mr. Wolson about the Tom Rider Media Index. Have begun to pin-point local network affiliates and their contact information.	6.50	Margaret R. Burton
7/8/04	Draft stipulation extending time for expert disclosures.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
7/8/04	Edit expert retainer letter, telephone conference with Gene Gulland re same, draft memos to Julie Strauss re expert retainer letter.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
7/8/04	Draft expert interview memos.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
7/8/04	Researched network affiliates and their contact information for the Tom Rider Media Index. Continued to work on the Feld Production Master Index.	6.25	Margaret R. Burton
7/9/04	Telephone conference with with Julie Strauss and Gary Jacobson re separation of juvenile elephants, telephone conference with Maura Dalton re same, review draft agreement with Ted Friend, telephone conference with Julie Strauss re same, edit draft agreement, draft memo to Gene Gulland and Maura Dalton re telephone conference with with Gary Jacobson.	1.75	Jeannie M. Perron
7/9/04	Draft expert interview memos.	0.50	Maura A. Dalton
7/9/04	Continued with the Feld Production Master Index.	6.00	Margaret R. Burton

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/12/04	Review Wolson memos and subpoena list; stipulation to extend expert deadlines.	1.50	Eugene D. Gulland
7/12/04	Memos and meeting re: elephant separation practices of Jacobson and Potential issues.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
7/12/04	Review and edit list of proposed subpoenas; send to client.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
7/12/04	Edit, finalize and send out retainer letters.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
7/12/04	Meeting with Ms. Crosby about paralegal duties. Continued with index.	2.00	Margaret R. Burton
7/13/04	Draft expert report outlines.	0.50	Maura A. Dalton
7/13/04	Meeting with Ms. Crosby about paralegal duties for Feld case. Discussion of witness files etc.	0.75	Margaret R. Burton
7/14/04	Review Rider interrogatory responses and outline subjects for deposition.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
7/14/04	Reviewing and logging descriptions of videotapes produced by plaintiffs.	3.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/14/04	Document review, read expert publications.	3.75	Maura A. Dalton
7/14/04	Meeting with Ms. Crosby to sort out Feld files, make boxes and labels etc. Continuation of Feld production index.	6.75	Margaret R. Burton
7/15/04	Reviewing and logging information about videotapes produced by plaintiffs.	6.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/15/04	Follow up conversation with Potential memo re: same.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
7/15/04	Organizing & labeling files for transfer	3.50	Elizabeth Crosby
7/16/04	Review expert outline; review interrogatory responses; list of potential subpoenas.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
7/16/04	Review of videotapes produced by plaintiffs.	4.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/16/04	Draft expert witness report outline.	7.00	Maura A. Dalton
7/16/04	Continuation of the Production Index.	6.50	Margaret R. Burton
7/18/04	Prepare draft agenda for meeting with client.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
7/19/04	Discovery matters; review agenda for meeting; calls re: Clyde problem.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
7/19/04	Expert witness memo follow up Potential	0.75	Maura A. Dalton
7/19/04	Meeting with Ms. Strosnider about Plaintiff's videotape production index. Discussion of format etc. Reserving a conference room, moving TV. Watching several hours of videotape while taking notes. Entered notes into table and sent copy to Ms. Strosnider.	7.00	Margaret R. Burton
7/20/04	Discovery matters and meetings re: Clyde problem; review AWA and Arizona law.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/20/04	Phone conversations with counsel for MCI Center re: production of video tapes.	1.00	Joshua Wolson
7/20/04	Reviewing documents produced by plaintiff AWI and videotapes produced by all plaintiffs and logging information on same; telephone call with J. Wolson regarding plaintiffs' third-party discovery.	5.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/20/04	Finished reviewing video tapes for production. Meeting with Ms. Strosnider to review selected portions of tapes. Discussion of document, "Plaintiff's Videotape Log". Continuation of Feld Production Index.	6.25	Margaret R. Burton
7/21/04	Address Dr. Friend engagement letter with Jeannie Perron and review draft	0.50	Harris Weinstein
7/21/04	Telephone conferences with Ted Friend and Julie Strauss re retainer agreements, edit retainer agreement and cover memo, draft memos to Julie Strauss, Gene Gulland and Harris Weinstein re same, conference call Potential and Maura Dalton re work as an expert witness.	2.25	Jeannie M. Perron
7/21/04	Phone call with Potential follow up re: same.	0.75	Maura A. Dalton
7/21/04	Continuation of Feld Production Index.	6.25	Margaret R. Burton
7/22/04	Discovery matters and review AWA provisions on transport; meet D. Schmidt and Potential	2.50	Eugene D. Gulland
7/22/04	Phone conversation with Julie Strauss re: confidentiality agreement for MCI Center subpoena; execute agreement and send to counsel for MCI Center.	0.75	Joshua Wolson
7/22/04	Draft memo to Gene Gulland and Harris Weinstein re Potential Potential review draft retainer agreement for Potential Witness prepare for and meeting with Dennis Schmidt re witness statement and meeting with Potential	4.25	Jeannie M. Perron
7/22/04	Potential interview memo, meet with D. Schmitt, Potential follow up call from meetings.	8.00	Maura A. Dalton
7/22/04	Continuation of Feld Production Index.	3.25	Margaret R. Burton
7/23/04	Work on expert discovery stipulation and review Dalton outlines.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
7/23/04	Review summer associate memos	0.75	Harris Weinstein
7/23/04	Discuss status of document review with Maura Dalton and Kim Strosnider.	0.50	Joshua Wolson
7/23/04	Telephone conference with Potential re Elephant Manager's Manual.	0.25	Jeannie M. Perron
7/23/04	Reviewing and logging information about documents produced by plaintiff AWI; meeting with paralegal, M. Burton, regarding upcoming tasks; telephone call with J. Wolson and M. Dalton regarding discovery and tasks to be completed.	2.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/23/04	Draft interview memo, Potential interview outline.	4.25	Maura A. Dalton
7/23/04	Completed Feld Production Master Index. Brief meeting with Mr. Wolson re Index. Meeting with Ms. Strosnider to discuss Key Documents Binder and determine the status of PL documents. Discussed projects for Monday.	6.50	Margaret R. Burton
7/26/04	Work on expert reports and other discovery issues.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
7/26/04	Telephone conferences with Julie Strauss and Gene Gulland re current elephant matter, draft memo to Josh Wolson and gene Gulland re same.	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
7/26/04	Reviewing and logging information about documents produced by all plaintiffs jointly; meeting with paralegal, M. Burton, about key documents and Tom Rider media interview log.	4.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/26/04	Draft Potential interview memo, expert witness outline; send retainer letter.	7.00	Maura A. Dalton
7/26/04	Began process of compiling the Key Documents Binder (KDB). Included documents from Ms. Strosnider (more to come), Ms. Dalton, and Mr. Wolson. Brief meeting with Ms. Dalton regarding the documents she wishes to include in KDB. Meeting with Ms. Strosnider to discuss specifics of KDB including organization and document review notes. Also discussed video production by plaintiff. Review of video index and Tom Rider Media Index to begin matching process of news clips and Tom Riders production.	6.75	Margaret R. Burton
7/27/04	Calls w/Julie Strauss re: meeting with Pote and other issues.	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
7/27/04	Review and edit draft summary of Potential witness interview and witness outline.	2.25	Jeannie M. Perron
7/27/04	Draft Schmitt expert report.	8.75	Maura A. Dalton
7/27/04	Review of Plaintiff produced video tapes (PL 07066-PL 07085) to match news clips to the Tom Rider media Index. Internet searches to find contact information for remaining media sources. Honing searches for affiliates who's contact information isn't readily available. Internet searches to find Tom Rider newspaper articles in on-line archives.	6.75	Margaret R. Burton
7/28/04	Work on expert outlines.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
7/28/04	Review subpoenas served on Ed Stewart and PAWS; phone conference with counsel for ASPCA re: deposition scheduling; work on possible stipulation regarding expert discovery.	1.25	Joshua Wolson

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/28/04	Telephone conference with Potential re areas of testimony and scheduling, telephone conference with Maura Dalton re expert reports, review memo from Ted Friend re his testimony, edit draft agreement with Ted Friend and draft memo in response, telephone conferences with Gene Gulland and Julie Strauss re same, meeting with Josh Wolson re correspondence with experts, telephone conference with Gene Gulland re earlier correspondence with Potential telephone conference with Potential telephone conferences with Gene Gulland, Maura Dalton and Julie Strauss re same.	4.50	Jeannie M. Perron
7/28/04	Reviewing and logging information about documents produced by all plaintiffs; meeting with paralegal, M. Burton, regarding key documents and efforts to obtain T. Rider media interviews.	0.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/28/04	Draft Schmitt expert report; phone calls to set up follow up interviews; review 3rd party subpoenas.	10.00	Maura A. Dalton
7/28/04	Continuation of Tom Rider media index. Cross-referencing with documents and tapes we already have to determine which media clips need to be ordered. Brief meeting with Ms. Strosnider to update her on my progress with this project. Discussed how to proceed.	5.75	Margaret R. Burton
7/29/04	Review expert report outlines from Perron.	1.00	Eugene D. Gulland
7/29/04	Phone conversations with Gene Gulland regarding upcoming depositions; draft stipulation regarding expert witnesses; phone conversation with Julie Strauss and Gary Kolker to discuss MCI Center subpoena; review confidential agreement sent to Madison Square Garden and call counsel for Madison Square Garden; meet with Margaret Burton to discuss discovery review.	3.50	Joshua Wolson
7/29/04	Edit Friend retainer agreement, draft Potential retainer agreement, edit cover e-mail to Ted Friend, edit friend opinion outline, draft Potential opinion outline, telephone conference with Potential Potential re logistics of meeting, telephone conferences with Maura Dalton, Julie Strauss, Gene Gulland and Kim Strosnider re same, telephone conference with Gene Gulland re opinion outlines, review draft stipulation re exchange of expert documents, telephone conference with Josh Wolson re same.	5.00	Jeannie M. Perron
7/29/04	Reviewing and logging information about documents produced by all plaintiffs; reviewing and editing expert retention letter for Pot Potential and discussion of letter with J. Perron; telephone calls with J. Wolson and M. Burton on discovery issues.	2.75	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/29/04	Draft Schmitt expert reports, Potential interview memo.	6.75	Maura A. Dalton

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
7/29/04	Process of moving 10 boxes of materials produced by Plaintiff from conference room 1060 to 350 in anticipation of construction in West Building. Completion of Space Request Form. Meetings with Ms. Bolander to discuss anticipated space needs, discuss the layout and organization of 350 etc. Created labels for all boxes. Meeting with librarian to find Washington Post article on Tom Rider Media Index from LexisNexis. Continued to search web for media clips for the Tom Rider Media Index. Meeting with Mr. Wolson about progress with media index. Agreed to continue searching web to pull off whatever media clips we can find free of charge before ordering copies of media clips we don't have or can't find. Discussed security tapes that arrived from client and the list of relevant times provided by client. Attempted to contact Ms. Pree about getting a copy of the list. Discussed starting folders on Ed Stewart and Pat Derby and the creation of a Deposition Tracking Sheet. Brief phone calls with Ms. Strosnider to discuss latest documents she reviewed and needs to have copied and to discuss the movement of boxes from 1060.	6.25	Margaret R. Burton
7/30/04	Calls w/Sukumar.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
7/30/04	Telephone conference with Ted Friend re latest version of agreement, prepare for and travel to and from New York re meeting with Potential meeting with Potential review and respond to memo from Ted Friend re retainer agreement, draft memo to Ted Friend re outline for opinion.	7.00	Jeannie M. Perron
7/30/04	Revising Potential contract.	0.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
7/30/04	Went to Ms. Pree's desk to look for letter detailing pertant times for the security tapes. Could not find letter and let Mr. Wolson know of this via email since he is out of town. Created format for Feld Entertainment Deposition Tracking Sheet at the request of Mr. Wolson. Copied flagged documents in PL 03216 - PL 05118 given to me by Ms. Strosnider for the Key Documents Binder. Finished searching for media clips for the Tom Rider Media Index on the World Wide Web.	1.00	Margaret R. Burton
Total Hours:		288.00	

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60343623

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	18.50	\$10,360.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	1.75	\$945.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	36.00	\$14,040.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	14.00	\$4,340.00
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	29.50	\$7,817.50
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	72.25	\$19,146.25
Elizabeth Crosby	Paralegal	\$160.00	10.00	\$1,600.00
Margaret R. Burton	Paralegal	\$150.00	105.75	\$15,862.50
Elena Howell	Library Staff	\$100.00	0.25	\$25.00
Total			288.00	\$74,136.25

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	188.24
Computer Research	516.95
Depositions & Transcripts	29.70
Audio Visual (video tape duplication)	283.62
Long Distance Calls	37.26
Travel	65.98
Process Servers - Expert publications	96.00
Couriers And Messengers	39.72
Federal Express	36.81
TOTAL	\$ 1,294.28

Total Fee:	\$ 74,136.25
Total Client Charges:	1,294.28
Total This Invoice:	<u>\$ 75,430.53</u>

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER:

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60343623

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy

COVINGTON & BURLING

1201 PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE NW
WASHINGTON, DC 20004-2401
TEL 202.682.6000
FAX 202.682.6291
WWW.COV.COM

WASHINGTON, DC
NEW YORK
LONDON
BRUSSELS
SAN FRANCISCO

INVOICE NUMBER
60345738
ACCOUNT NUMBER
025557.00106
DATE
September 23, 2004

Feld Entertainment, Inc.

ASPCA/Rider Litigation

For professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter for the period August 1, 2004, through August 31, 2004, as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/2/04	Review expert reports and Madison Square Garden issues.	1.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/2/04	Edit opinion of Potential [redacted] and background memoranda, review Elephant Husbandry Resource Guide.	2.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/2/04	Meeting with paralegal, M. Burton, regarding document review issues, including compilation of key documents; reviewing voicemail from J. Wolson and drafting email to H. Weinstein, J. Wolson, G. Gulland, and M. Dalton regarding Madison Square Garden confidentiality agreement with plaintiffs; reviewing Fed. R. Civ. P. 30(b), advisory committee notes, and annotations for rules on videotaping of depositions.	2.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider
8/2/04	Organized Key Documents Binder into potential sections. Brief meeting with Ms. Strosnider about the KDB to discuss progress and organization of binder. Discussed the MCI Center security tapes and the letter detailing the relevant times to watch. Ran internet searches for Pat Derby and Ed Stewart of PAWS at request of Mr. Wolson. Finished labeling boxes of documents delivered to me from Mr. Wolson to hold until further notice.	5.00	Margaret R. Burton
8/3/04	Expert reports; confer w/team re: depositions.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/3/04	Privilege [redacted]	2.75	Jeannie M. Perron
8/3/04	Reviewing and logging information about documents produced by all plaintiffs; researching Fed. R. Civ. P. 30(b) and rules relating to notice of videotaped depositions; drafting email to J. Wolson summarizing research on videotaping of depositions.	5.00	Kimberly A. Strosnider

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/3/04	Took new pleadings entry to PSU to have it scanned so that I could enter it into electronic pleadings index. Continued to pull articles off World Wide Web in reference to Pat Derby and Ed Stewart of PAWS for Mr. Wolson. Found letter from Katherine A. Meyer detailing segments of tapes 1-13 (except 11, which is missing) from the Washington Sports and Entertainment Center that Plaintiffs wish to use in litigation. At request of Mr. Wolson, began review of sections in tapes noted by Plaintiffs in letter. Reviewed tapes 1-9. Created Excel spreadsheet for the video log. Privilege	6.25	Margaret R. Burton
8/4/04	Review and edit draft opinion of Dennis Schmidt.	3.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/4/04	Finished watching and taking notes on WSE video #10, 12, and 13. Entered comments into Excel Document "Feld Entertainment Review of Washington Sports and Entertainment Security Tapes Produced by Plaintiffs". Edited document and sent a copy to Mr. Wolson for review. Continued internet searches for Pat Derby and Ed Stewart.	6.75	Margaret R. Burton
8/5/04	Review summary of tapes produced by Madison Square Garden; review memorandum on notice requirements for plaintiffs to videotape Ed Stewart deposition.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
8/5/04	Edit opinion of Dennis Schmidt and draft opinion of Potential review memo from Julie Strauss re Potential	5.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/5/04	Located Motion to Dismiss File and made copies of various documents for Ms. Perron. Continued internet searches for Ed Stewart and Pat Derby to make file for Mr. Wolson.	6.25	Margaret R. Burton
8/6/04	Prepare for depositions of MCI Center witness and Ed Stewart.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
8/6/04	Edit opinion of Potential review memo from Potential telephone conference with Gene Gulland re same, telephone conference with Josh Wolson and Maura Dalton re various issues.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
8/6/04	Searching all production logs for any documents related to Pat Derby, Ed Stewart, and PAWS in preparation for upcoming depositions. Brief meeting with Mr. Wolson to touch base about completed WSE videotape review and spreadsheet and projects for next week.	3.00	Margaret R. Burton
8/9/04	Privilege	0.50	Eugene D. Gulland
8/9/04	Prepare for deposition of Ed Stewart; phone conversation with Jerry Sowalsky re: same; review proposed protective order regarding Madison Square Garden.	2.50	Joshua Wolson
8/9/04	Meeting with Maura Dalton and telephone conference with Gene Gulland re Schmidt affidavit.	0.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/9/04	Read AZA manual on elephant case and prepare notes; call D. Schmitt re: expert report.	5.00	Maura A. Dalton

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

FCM Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/9/04	Sent copies of Derby/Stewart/PAWS- related documents to Mr. Wolson. Filed originals in room 350. Checked status of videotapes to be copied and sent to Plaintiff. Drafted letter accompany duplicated tapes. Sent letter, tapes and copy of invoice to Plaintiff by outside messenger.	2.50	Margaret R. Burton
8/10/04	Review and comment on expert stipulation; call w/Wolson on Sacramento deposition.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/10/04	Attend deposition of MCI Center witness; prepare for Stewart deposition.	6.50	Joshua Wolson
8/10/04	Reviewing and logging information about documents produced by all plaintiffs jointly.	3.25	Kimberly A. Strosnider
8/10/04	Work on expert reports, review plaintiffs' pleadings, discuss status with J. Wolson.	3.75	Maura A. Dalton
8/10/04	Followed up with Ms. Dalton about the Key Documents Binder. Correspondence with Ms. Strosnider about the Key Documents Binder and last box of documents produced by Plaintiff that she reviewed.	0.50	Margaret R. Burton
8/11/04	Redraft stipulation re: experts and telephone call to Josh Wolson re: same ; Feld expert stipulation	0.25	Harris Weinstein
8/11/04	Prepare for deposition of Ed Stewart; review expert stipulation as proposed by Kathy Meyer .	3.00	Joshua Wolson
8/11/04	Drafting email on document review to J. Wolson and M. Dalton; meeting with paralegal, M. Burton, about files and status of discovery.	0.50	Kimberly A. Strosnider
8/11/04	Interview with D. Schmitt re: expert report, review E. Gulland comments on reports; follow up re: same; read AZA manual.	6.75	Maura A. Dalton
8/11/04	Comparison of remaining documents from Ms. Strosnider's Plaintiff document review with the Tom Rider Media Index to determine if there were any matches. Brief meeting with Ms. Strosnider to wrap up the Key Documents Binder and discuss any loose ends before her upcoming maternity leave. Touched base with Ms. Dalton about the remaining documents she wants to include in the binder. Internet search for Mr. Wolson for Circus Insider's article about PAWS violations of the AWA.	5.75	Margaret R. Burton
8/12/04	Calls and emails on Sacramento deposition and expert designations.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/12/04	Prepare for deposition of Ed Stewart; meet with Maura Dalton to discuss documents to seek from Potentia	6.50	Joshua Wolson
8/12/04	Meet w. J. Wolson re: Pote documents and Stewart deposition; follow up re: same.	2.00	Maura A. Dalton
8/12/04	Compiling Ed Stewart Deposition Preparation Binder for Mr. Wolson. Searching for possible PAWS violations of AWA.	2.50	Margaret R. Burton

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/13/04	Prepare for Ed Stewart deposition.	5.50	Joshua Wolson
8/13/04	Meeting Josh Wolson re edit Stewart deposition, telephone conference with Maura Dalton re status and meeting with Maura Dalton re documents for Pote telephone conferences with Potent Potential and telephone conference with Maura Dalton re same.	1.00	Jeannie M. Perron
8/13/04	Meet w. J. Perron re: expert reports; follow up re: same, revise expert reports.	1.00	Maura A. Dalton
8/13/04	Compiling Ed Stewart Deposition Preparation Binder for Mr. Wolson. Contacted USDA APHIS to determine how to obtain inspection reports of PAWS.	2.50	Margaret R. Burton
8/15/04	Prepare for and travel to deposition of Ed Stewart.	11.50	Joshua Wolson
8/16/04	Attend deposition of Ed Stewart.	9.00	Joshua Wolson
8/16/04	Revise D. Schmitt report; work with M. Burton re: Pote binder.	2.25	Maura A. Dalton
8/16/04	Meeting with Ms. Dalton to discuss creation of an Elephant Treatment Binder and the documents to be included in it. Reviewed AZA manual and copied pages specified by Ms. Dalton and compiled other packets from the Key Documents Binder.	4.50	Margaret R. Burton
8/17/04	Work on Schmidt report.	0.75	Eugene D. Gulland
8/17/04	Travel from Ed Stewart deposition to Washington.	6.00	Joshua Wolson
8/17/04	Meet with J. Wolson re: update on case; email discussions with E. Gulland, J. Perron re: Potential agreement letter.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
8/18/04	Edit stipulation regarding expert discovery; phone call with Jerry Sowalsky to discuss Stewart deposition.	2.25	Joshua Wolson
8/18/04	Meeting with Mr. Skelley of PISD to discuss various document and general case management strategies including 1) setting up LiveNote for deposition transcripts 2) a public calendar in Microsoft Outlook 3) a public folder in iManage for all case documents 4) scanning all case documents to have an electronic copy available on the network. After consulting Mr. Wolson, Mr. Skelley and I are going forward with numbers 1-3, but not number 4. At the request of Mr. Wolson, began process of scanning pleadings from the original Feld case and the Court of Appeals case to integrate them into the pleadings index for the current case (2003).	4.00	Margaret R. Burton
8/19/04	At Mr. Wolson's request, updating pleadings index to include the pleadings from the original Feld case and the Court of Appeals case, including scanning documets, importing documents into iManage, and inserting them into index one at a time. Coordinating meetings with Mr. Skelley to go forward with implementing the public folder and public calendar.	6.00	Margaret R. Burton

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/20/04	Phone call with T. Friend re: report; follow up with J. Perron re: same and re: Potential [] letter; e mail re: voicemail from Potential Witness to J. Perron and E. Gulland; email re: elephant rejection of calves.	4.00	Maura A. Dalton
8/20/04	Continuation of Electronic Pleadings Index. Scanning and creating links to pleadings for original Feld and Court of Appeals cases. Meeting with Mr. Zager about LiveNote and how to set it up.	5.75	Margaret R. Burton
8/23/04	Review proposed stipulation re: expert discovery and discuss same with Josh Wolson	0.75	Harris Weinstein
8/23/04	Telephone conferences with Maura Dalton and Gene Gulland re experts, review expert stipulation, telephone conference with Josh Wolson re same, review draft Schmidt opinion, telephone conferences with Maura Dalton re Potential Witness []	3.25	Jeannie M. Perron
8/23/04	Phone call with Potential Witness [] re: expert retainer agreement, review key document binder.	1.50	Maura A. Dalton
8/23/04	Completion of Electronic Pleadings Index. Sent to Mr. Wolson for review. Meeting with Mr. Skelley and Mr. Roberts about setting up a public folder and public calendar for the team working on the Feld case. Began making three copies of the KDB. Internet searches to determine what is necessary to make a FOIA request re Carol Buckley and the Elephant Sanctuary. Searched the APHIS FOIA Electronic Reading Room to determine if there is anything already available without a request. Reported results to Mr. Wolson.	7.25	Margaret R. Burton
8/24/04	Work on expert reports.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
8/24/04	Telephone conferences with Maura Dalton re arranging for conference call with Potential [] telephone conference with Potential []	0.75	Jeannie M. Perron
8/24/04	Calls with J. Perron and D. Schmitt.	0.75	Maura A. Dalton
8/24/04	Meeting with Mr. Wolson to discuss completed Electronic Pleadings Index. Made suggested changes to integrate the various Feld cases into one chronological index and sent copy to Mr. Wolson for final review. Finished making three copies of the KDB. Gave copy to Mr. Wolson to review before distributing it to the rest of the team. Brief meeting with Mr. Wolson to discuss David Coley's (of the MCI Center) deposition and the creation of a deposition digest. Began the creation of the digest after having the transcript uploaded on LiveNote.	7.25	Margaret R. Burton
8/25/04	Expert reports.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland
8/25/04	Draft Potential [] expert opinion and edit Potential [] retainer letter, draft memos to Potential [] re same.	5.00	Jeannie M. Perron
8/26/04	Work on expert reports; review regulations on Friend temperature issues.	1.25	Eugene D. Gulland

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial []

Feld Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/26/04	Review and comment and draft Schmidt expert report; telephone call and brief discussion with Gene Gulland re: same	2.50	Harris Weinstein
8/26/04	Edit Ted Friend's report, telephone conferences with Ted Friend re same and re his documents, telephone conferences with and draft memos to Potential [redacted] re her report and re background documents, telephone conference with Dennis Schmidt and draft memo to him, telephone conference with Feld Entertainment re payments to experts, meeting with Gene Gulland re expert reports, edit Dennis Schmidt's expert report.	6.75	Jeannie M. Perron
8/26/04	Phone calls with J. Perron re: expert materials; read D. Schmitt materials.	1.75	Maura A. Dalton
8/26/04	At Mr. Wolson's request, began deposition digest of David Clarence Coley of the MCI Center.	3.75	Margaret R. Burton
8/27/04	Review articles written by Dennis Schmitt and Potential Witness [redacted]	2.50	Joshua Wolson
8/27/04	Review and edit Ted Friend report, telephone conferences with Ted Friend, Dennis Schmidt and Potential [redacted] re their reports and re documents, telephone conference with Julie Strauss re expert issues, research legislative history of 9 CFR 3.140, telephone conferences with Potential Witness [redacted] re same, telephone conference with Feld, Inc. re payments to experts.	5.75	Jeannie M. Perron
8/27/04	Internet research and document translation for Mr. Cooper.	3.75	Margaret R. Burton
8/27/04	CFR statute research with Mr. Mao regarding "ambient temperatures" for Ms. Perron.	3.75	Margaret R. Burton
8/29/04	Review references received from Dennis Schmidt, Ted Friend and Potential [redacted]	5.00	Jeannie M. Perron
8/30/04	Discuss expert reports with Jeannie Perron	0.25	Harris Weinstein
8/30/04	Telephone call with Jerry Sowalsky re: APHIS subpoena issue; brief discussion with Jeannie Perron and brief telephone call with Josh Wolson re: same	0.50	Harris Weinstein
8/30/04	Review articles written by Potential [redacted] and Dennis Schmitt.	1.50	Joshua Wolson
8/30/04	Review Ted Friend reference, research regulatory history of 9 CFR Section 142, edit draft opinions of Dennis Schmidt, Potential [redacted] and Ted Friend.	8.25	Jeannie M. Perron
8/30/04	Completed draft of deposition digest of David Coley of WSE for Mr. Wolson and sent him a draft. Delivered remaining copies of the KDB. Copies of notes from expert witnesses for Ms. Perron. Entered Pre-Trial schedule into Outlook Public Calendar.	5.00	Margaret R. Burton
8/31/04	Meeting w/team re: transportation temperature regulations and Friend testimony; work on expert reports.	2.00	Eugene D. Gulland
8/31/04	Meeting with Gene Gulland, Jeannie Perron and Josh Wolson re: expert issues; expert reports	1.75	Harris Weinstein

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial [redacted]

Field Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>
8/31/04	Meeting with Harris Weinstein, Gene Gulland, and Jeannie Perron to discuss expert reports.	1.25	Joshua Wolson
8/31/04	Meeting with Gene Gulland, Harris Weinstein and Josh Wolson re Ted Friend's testimony and re opinion of Dennis Schmidt, review Ted Friend's publications re temperature information, edit opinions of Dennis Schmidt, Ted Friend and Potential Witness telephone conferences with Dennis Schmidt, Ted Friend and Pote Potential re draft opinions, telephone conference with Julie Strauss re expert opinions.	8.50	Jeannie M. Perron
8/31/04	Copies for Ms. Perron. Brief meeting with Ms. Perron to discuss the creation of an index to log Dr. Schmitt's correspondence with RBBB. Also discussed content of boxes of presentation material delivered from Dr. Schmitt and how to organize it. Created index and sent it to Ms. Perron for review. Organized two boxes of Schmitt presentation materials and indexed elephant related material that was not covered by the index included with these materials.	8.00	Margaret R. Burton
Total Hours:		279.00	

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Eugene D. Gulland	Partner	\$560.00	11.00	\$6,160.00
Harris Weinstein	Partner	\$540.00	6.00	\$3,240.00
Jeannie M. Perron	Special Couns.	\$390.00	60.00	\$23,400.00
Joshua Wolson	Associate	\$310.00	61.00	\$18,910.00
Kimberly A. Strosnider	Associate	\$265.00	10.75	\$2,848.75
Maura A. Dalton	Associate	\$265.00	30.25	\$8,016.25
Margaret R. Burton	Paralegal	\$150.00	100.00	\$15,000.00
Total			279.00	\$77,575.00

Client Charges Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Duplicating	927.00
Computer Research	177.35
Business Meals	141.41
Depositions & Transcripts	341.00

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Field Entertainment, Inc.
 ASPCA/Rider Litigation
 025557.00106
 Invoice No.: 60345738

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Long Distance Calls	40.32
Travel	214.00
Lodging	370.18
Air Rail Travel	1,103.85
Color Copying	3,412.00
Messengers	15.85
Federal Express	16.59
TOTAL	\$ 6,759.55

Total Fee:	\$ 77,575.00
Total Client Charges:	6,759.55
Total This Invoice:	\$ 84,334.55

RETURN LAST PAGE WITH REMITTANCE

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: Financial

Reid Entertainment, Inc.
ASPCA/Rider Litigation
025557.00106
Invoice No.: 60345738

Remittance Page

Financial Privacy